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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Claims <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>
Sent: Thursday, 27 April 2023 10:30 AM
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Admin A; CS A Team
Cc: 'Claims'
Subject: RE: ACCEPT OFFER - AIS REF: AWLAISCL2022-009FR-SNB3785Y - ACCIDENT 

INVOLVING VEHICLE SFW 8998 B & YOUR INSURED SNB 3785 Y ON 6/11/2022 - TF 
*** LKK REF: CC4/AIS22011150/pa3

Attachments: 8998 LOA.pdf

Dear Hsiao Tong, 
 
We confirm your offer of S$ 18,287.45 in settlement of our client’s claim. 
 
Attached is our LOA for your next action. 
 
Our DBS bank info is as follows :-  
 

Company Name Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd 
Company Reg No.  199902271W 
Address 55 UBI ROAD 1 (SINGAPORE 408699) 
Contact No. 6388 2323 
    
Bank Transfer Details   
Beneficiary   
Bank Name The Development Bank of Singapore Limited 
Bank Branch   

Bank Address 450 Clementi Avenue 3, #01-293/295, Singapore 120450 
Bank Code 7171 
Branch Code   
SWIFT Code DBSSSGSG (remains the same for all currency accounts) 
Bank Account No. 020-011138-0 
Currency SGD 
Remittance Attention To 
Email Claims@premiumauto.com.sg 

  
Thank you. 
 
Best Regards, 
Nadia Hani  
Claims Administrator 
 
Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd  (Reg No 199902271W) 
55 Ubi Road 1 Road Singapore 408699 
p. +65 6388 2323  d. +65 6768 9911  m. +65 8826 8736 
e. claims@premiumauto.com.sg   w. www.audi.com.sg 
Audi Showroom, Audi Centre  281 Alexandra Road   Singapore 159938  p. +65 6836 2223 
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Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Sent: Monday, May 8, 2023 5:01 PM
To: ABSOLUTEWHEELSLEASINGSG@GMAIL.COM
Cc: Admin A
Subject: RE: CLAIM NOTIFICATION - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SNB3785Y(ALLIANZ) AND 

SFW8998B AT/ALONG OUTSIDE 19 RECREATION ROAD ON 06/11/2022
Attachments: 08052023140341-0001.pdf

Dear Sirs, 
 
Received with thanks. 
 
 

 
Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

 
 

From: absolute wheels <absolutewheelsleasingsg@gmail.com>  
Sent: Monday, May 8, 2023 2:00 PM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: CLAIM NOTIFICATION - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SNB3785Y(ALLIANZ) AND SFW8998B AT/ALONG OUTSIDE 19 
RECREATION ROAD ON 06/11/2022 
 
 
 
On Mon, May 8, 2023 at 8:53 AM Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

URGENT 

  

Dear Sirs, 

  

We wish to inform you that the date of accident should be 06/11/2022 instead of 07/11/2022 as reported. Please assist 
to sign on the addendum form attached and return it to us ( LKK ) via email for our further action. 
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Thank you. 

  

  

  

Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

  

  

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)  
Sent: Friday, November 11, 2022 4:20 PM 
To: ABSOLUTEWHEELSLEASINGSG@GMAIL.COM 
Subject: CLAIM NOTIFICATION - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SNB3785Y(ALLIANZ) AND SFW8998B AT/ALONG OUTSIDE 19 
RECREATION ROAD ON 06/11/2022 

  

ABSOLUTE WHEELS LEASING PTE LTD                                                              [By Email Only] 

DRIVER: NG JUN YAN KENNETH 

  

Dear Sir/Madam, 

  

You Ref: SNB3785Y 

Our Ref: CC4/AIS22011150/pa3 

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SNB3785Y(ALLIANZ) AND SFW8998B AT/ALONG OUTSIDE 19 RECREATION ROAD ON 
06/11/2022 
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We refer to the above subject matter.  We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed by your motor 
insurer, Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd to deal with the third party claim against your policy. 

  

We have received a claim from SFW8998B against your insurance policy. 

                

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, we are of the view that liability is not in your driver’s favour. 
Therefore, we shall proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement of the third-party claim at best to avoid further 
litigation, which would escalate to even more cost.  

  

Please be informed that your No Claim Discount (NCD) may be affected as a result of the claim against your policy. We 
also wish to inform you that there is Section II excess of $1,500.00 + $2,500.00(Driving Licence less than 2 years)(Before 
GST) for third party claim settlements. 

  

  

As Insurers, they shall proceed to deal with the claim(s) subject to the merits of the case and according to the rights 
afforded under the policy. Should you not be seeking the protection of your policy and seek to take conduct of third 
party claim(s) arising from this incident, at your own cost and defence, please reply to us within 7 days from the date of 
this letter. Your intent must be formally expressed to Allianz and acknowledged by Allianz. 

  

To protect your interest(s) in the handling of this claim, please do not discuss liability with any of the Third Party(s) 
and/or their legal representatives, or make any compromise or settlement without our prior knowledge and consent. If 
you receive any correspondence or legal document such as a Writ of Summons in connection with this accident, please 
forward it to us immediately. You may email it to customerservice@allianz.com.sg or deliver it by hand 
to Allianz Customer Care Centre. 

  

This letter should not be regarded as a waiver by Allianz of their rights to repudiate any claim because of any breach of 
policy terms and conditions you and/or your authorised driver may have committed. 

  

In the event of receiving and handling of any third-party injury claim(s), we shall keep you informed of the final 
indemnity upon conclusion of the matter(s).  

  

If you need any clarification, please do not hesitate to contact as at 6742 3197 or chewht@lkkauto.com. 
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Thank you. 

  

  

  

  

Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 
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Claim Audit

 

  AUDIT TRAIL
No. On Audit Remarks By

1
08 Nov
2022
17:06

Clm Dtl Modified Claimant's Name: -> TEO HUI YU RICHARD. Claimant's ID: -> S1434174I. [A] HOW
MEI KWAN

2
08 Nov
2022
17:06

Clm Veh Model
Changed (204858) AUDI A3 1.4 SEDAN TFSI (AMBIENTE) (A). [A] HOW

MEI KWAN

3
08 Nov
2022
17:06

Clm Created
Reg No: SFW8998B. Acct Date: 2022/11/06. Claim Type: TP. Insurer: Allianz Insurance Singapo
re Pte. Ltd. (HQ). TP Insurer: FWD Singapore Pte. Ltd. (HQ). Workshop: Premium Automobiles
Pte Ltd (HQ)

[A] HOW
MEI KWAN

4
08 Nov
2022
17:06

Adj Co Assigned LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ): [A] HOW
MEI KWAN

5
08 Nov
2022
17:06

Adj Next Rpt
Changed Next Rpt:Final Rpt.Due Date:2022/11/17 [A] HOW

MEI KWAN

6
08 Nov
2022
17:06

Adj Mandate Set Approved:0.00.Reinsp:Adj decides. [A] HOW
MEI KWAN

7
08 Nov
2022
17:06

Adj Adjuster
Assigned [None] -> ADRIAN LING [A] HOW

MEI KWAN

8
11 Nov
2022
15:51

Clm Registration
Modified Pol No:->SPMF1000000545. [I] Faiz Rosli

9
11 Nov
2022
15:51

Video
Downloaded Downloaded Video - Accident [I] Faiz Rosli

10
11 Nov
2022
15:56

Adj Next Rpt
Changed

Next Rpt:Final Rpt.Due Date:2022/11/17. Mandate Remarks: Minor to Major - Proceed w DS. S
ection 2 Excess $1.5K + $2.5K(DL less than 2 yrs) [I] Faiz Rosli

11
11 Nov
2022
15:56

Adj Mandate Set Approved:0.00:Minor to Major - Proceed w DS. Section 2 Excess $1.5K + $2.5K(DL less than 2
yrs) [I] Faiz Rosli

12
13 Nov
2022
18:22

Adj Adjuster
Assigned ADRIAN LING -> CHEN TSUE YEE [A] HOW

MEI KWAN

13
17 Mar
2023
10:56

Adj Mandate
Request

Cur.Req:22599.39:Liability: 100%. Insured driver turned out from house lot and collided with t
hird party. We seek your mandate at $21,988.39(if claim LOU) / $22,599.39(if claim LOR). TP-
Mandate IA had been uploaded in Merimen.

[A] CHEW
HSIAO TONG

14
17 Mar
2023
13:55

Adj Mandate Set Approved:22599.39. [I] Faiz Rosli

Date From       Date To       Audit Type None Go

ACTIVITY
No record

Merimen Billing for this case - Transaction History

Bill Ref No Bill Date Bill Type Acc Type Acc Name Co Name
(Branch) Ref 1 Ref 2 Amount

2866301 08 Nov 2022
17:06:09

TP Case
(Insurer) Motor

Allianz
Insurance

Singapore Pte.
Ltd. (HQ)

Allianz
Insurance

Singapore Pte.
Ltd. (HQ)

SFW8998B xx.xx

2866350 08 Nov 2022
18:20:22 Video Upload Motor

Allianz
Insurance

Singapore Pte.
Ltd. (HQ)

Allianz
Insurance

Singapore Pte.
Ltd. (HQ)

SFW8998B HOW MEI
KWAN xx.xx
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