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Meng Yan (LKK Auto)

From: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>
Sent: Monday, 7 November 2022 5:21 PM
To: TeamAutoPro North; admin-d
Cc: admin-d
Subject: AIS REF: TBC/JK - SMJ6363G -  Own Damage Claim: SMJ 6363 G(Our Ref) DOA 

04/11/2022  

Internal 

 
Dear Sir, 
 
Please be informed we had appointed LKK to conduct desktop survey. 
 
@Yan (LKK Auto) Merimen has been created. 
 
Thank you  
 
 
Janice Koh 
Claims Specialist 
Claims & Performance Management 
 
Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. | UEN 201903913C 
79 Robinson Road #09-01, Singapore 068897 
www.allianz.sg  
 

 

Please note: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential and / or privileged 
information. If you are not the intended recipient, please do not read, copy, use or disclose the contents of this communication to others and notify 
the sender immediately. Then please delete the e-mail and any copies of it. Thank you. 

 Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail. 
 

From: TeamAutoPro North <teamautopl@gmail.com>  
Sent: 7 November, 2022 02:39 PM 
To: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg> 
Subject: [EXT] Own Damage Claim: SMJ 6363 G(Our Ref) DOA 04/11/2022 Policy: SP2001950571-01 
 
 
 

Dear Sir/Madam, 
Road Traffic Accident Involving SMJ 6363 G (Our Ref) 
Dated 4th November 2022, Time around 1908Hrs 
@ CTE Towards City Before Exit 10 
 

We represent our mutual client ; Mr Boey Jia Rong of carplate# SMJ 6363 G, to notify you of the aforesaid 

road traffic accident for the purpose of OD claim.  
 
Kindly assist to arrange the required survey ASAP to avoid any inconvenience to our client. 
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Enclosed herewith the relevant Singapore Accident Statement filed for your reference. 

  

Thank you for your attention to this email and we look forward to your earliest reply. 

 

Please advise on the excess and loss of use.  

 

Thank you  

 

*The above settlement is in respect of our client for damage pertaining to his motor vehicle and shall 
not prejudice our client’s claim in respect of damages and consequential loss in relation to his personal 
injuries.* 
--------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------  
Best Regards, 
Wei Jie (Mr) 
Team AutoCare Pte Ltd 

 
Tel: 6258 1955 Fax: 6258 1956           
Main Office: 160 Sin Ming Dr,  #02-12 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722 
Workshop/Survey Venue: 160 Sin Ming Dr,  #01-14 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722 


