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Xin Yu  (LKK Auto)

From: Xin Yu  (LKK Auto)
Sent: Tuesday, November 15, 2022 11:21 AM
To: TeamAutoPro North
Cc: SUR; Taufikh (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: Deskstop survey for SMJ 6363 G
Attachments: SMJ 6363G Latest Marked Estimate.pdf

Dear Wei Jie, 
 
Please proceed the supplementary as attached with our surveyor marking. (Excess $600/-) Repair Days: 4 days; 
Lump Sum repair.  
 
 
Thanks and Warmest Regards, 

Xin Yu  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

phone: 6256-3561 | email: XinYu@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

From: TeamAutoPro North <teamautopl@gmail.com>  
Sent: Friday, November 11, 2022 10:59 AM 
To: Xin Yu (LKK Auto) <xinyu@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Meng Yan (LKK Auto) <mengyan@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Taufikh (LKKAuto) 
<Taufikh@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: Deskstop survey for SMJ 6363 G 
 
Dear Xin Yu 
 
Attached is the second survey for subject OD.  
 
Thank you 
 
 
*The above settlement is in respect of our client for damage pertaining to his motor vehicle and shall 
not prejudice our client’s claim in respect of damages and consequential loss in relation to his personal 
injuries.* 
 

**Dear all, please note that Team AutoPro Pte Ltd is GST registered w.e.f. 13th January 2021.    

--------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------  
Best Regards, 
Wei Jie (Mr) 
Team AutoPro Pte Ltd 

 
Tel: 6258 1955 Fax: 6258 1956           
Main Office: 160 Sin Ming Dr,  #02-12 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722 
Workshop/Survey Venue: 160 Sin Ming Dr,  #01-14 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722 
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On Thu, Nov 10, 2022 at 4:32 PM Xin Yu (LKK Auto) <xinyu@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Dear Wei Jie, 

  

Attached herewith our surveyor marking. 

  

As instructed by our client, please proceed to repair the insured vehicle SMJ 6363G (Excess $600/-) Repair Days: 4 
days ; Lump Sum repair.  

  

If there are any check items or supplementary items please inform our office’s Assignment Team at Tel: 6741 8434 
to arrange our surveyor for inspection.  

  

All supplementary items and unconfirm items are subjected to further approval from insurance company before 
completion of the repair. 

  

*Our client reserve their rights not to pay if there is no valid approval obtained before repair. 

  

  

Thanks and Warmest Regards, 

Xin Yu  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

phone: 6256-3561 | email: XinYu@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Meng Yan (LKK Auto) <mengyan@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, November 8, 2022 5:09 PM 
To: TeamAutoPro North <teamautopl@gmail.com> 
Cc: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: Deskstop survey for SMJ 6363 G 

  

Dear Wei Jie, 
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Received with thanks.  সহ঺঻ 

  

  

  

Best Regards, 

Yan | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com  | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: TeamAutoPro North <teamautopl@gmail.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, 8 November 2022 4:50 PM 
To: Meng Yan (LKK Auto) <mengyan@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: Deskstop survey for SMJ 6363 G 

  

Dear Meng Yan 
 
Attached is the estimate for this survey. 

 
 

*The above settlement is in respect of our client for damage pertaining to his motor vehicle and shall 
not prejudice our client’s claim in respect of damages and consequential loss in relation to his 
personal injuries.* 

  

**Dear all, please note that Team AutoPro Pte Ltd is GST registered w.e.f. 13th January 2021.    

--------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------  

Best Regards, 

Wei Jie (Mr) 

Team AutoPro Pte Ltd 
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Tel: 6258 1955 Fax: 6258 1956           

Main Office: 160 Sin Ming Dr,  #02-12 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722 

Workshop/Survey Venue: 160 Sin Ming Dr,  #01-14 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722 

  

  

On Tue, Nov 8, 2022 at 2:24 PM Meng Yan (LKK Auto) <mengyan@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Dear Wei Jie, 

  

Received with thanks. 

  

Kindly provide estimate and GIA report. 

  

Thank you. 

  

  

  

Best Regards, 

Yan | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com  | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: TeamAutoPro North <teamautopl@gmail.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, 8 November 2022 2:18 PM 
To: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Deskstop survey for SMJ 6363 G 
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Dear Sirs, 
 
Attached is the photo for SMJ 6363 G 

  

Thank you 

 
 

*The above settlement is in respect of our client for damage pertaining to his motor vehicle and shall 
not prejudice our client’s claim in respect of damages and consequential loss in relation to his 
personal injuries.* 

  

**Dear all, please note that Team AutoPro Pte Ltd is GST registered w.e.f. 13th January 2021.    

--------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------  

Best Regards, 

Wei Jie (Mr) 

Team AutoPro Pte Ltd 

 
Tel: 6258 1955 Fax: 6258 1956           

Main Office: 160 Sin Ming Dr,  #02-12 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722 

Workshop/Survey Venue: 160 Sin Ming Dr,  #01-14 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722 


