Xin Yu (LKK Auto)

From: Xin Yu (LKK Auto)

Sent: Friday, November 11, 2022 12:30 PM

To: Low, Poh Khim

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: BVS22/1032 - SND5384Y accident on 28/08/2022 - Request for the MV

Dear Poh Khim,

The MV of SND 5384Y is $130K-5132K(est) as at Aug 2022.

Thanks and Warmest Regards,

Xin Yu

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6256-3561 | email: XinYu@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Low, Poh Khim <low.pohkhim@libertyinsurance.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, November 7, 2022 7:15 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: BVS22/1032 - SND5384Y accident on 28/08/2022 - Request for the MV

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear All,

Seek your advice for the vehicle market value as per attached PV.



> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle
Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner 1D Type:

Owner ID:
Vehicle Details
Vehicle No.:
Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:
Vehicle Model:
Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year;
Engine No.:
Chassis No.:
Maximum Power Qutput:
Open Market Value:
Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:
Actual ARF Paid:
Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:
COE Category:
COE Period(Years):
QP Paid:
COE Rebate Amount:
Total Rebate Amount:
The information contained herein is correct as at 18 Oct 2022

Thank you

Poh Khim

Claims Department

Liberty Insurance Pte Ltd
51 Club Street #03-00 Liberty House

Singapore 069428
DID: (65) 6328 0746

Company
636C

SND5384Y

Mo

18 Oct 2022

M.G.

ZSEV AT DELUXE
Blue

2021

LSIW74096MZ 144860
105.0 kW (140 bhp)
$32,925.00

07 Jan 2022

07 Jan 2022

1]

$0.00

Yes
06 Jan 2032
$0.00

06 Jan 2032

B - Car above 1600cc or 97kW (1
10

$80,401.00

$74,111.00

$74,111.00



Insurance,

Liberty 5?’
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