Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 8 February 2023 8:26 AM

To: admin@mycar.sg

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: AIS REF: 2022 22004866SL/KC-SLK6830G - Appointment of PRI for SJJ3548X -

DOA: 13.5.2022

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Dear Sirs

Solely for purposes of amicable settlement, we are agreeable to resolve the matter at $$3,609.50(all in) in full and
final settlement of all claims your client has or may have against Allianz Insurance Singapore and/or their insured
arising out of this incident.

If the above offer is accepted, kindly confirm settlement by providing a copy of the Letter of Authorization /
Warrant to Act and your Bank details for us to process payment.

Please note that your client’s receipt of the settlement sum or settlement sums shall constitute a full discharge of
liability and waiver of any past, present or future claims your client may have against Allianz Insurance Singapore
and/or our insured as a result of the accident on 13 May 2022.

Please note that the clearance of this cheque / settlement sum or receipt of the successful electronic payment or
payments constitutes your client’s acceptance of payment and full discharge of liability.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
5(408933)

From: MY CAR CONSULTANT <admin@mycar.sg>

Sent: Friday, 3 February 2023 4:47 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: AIS REF: 2022 220048665L/KC-SLK6830G - Appointment of PRI for SJJ3548X - DOA: 13.5.2022

WITHOUT PREJUDICE



Dear Sirs,

Please proceed with offer

Best Regards,
Jackson

+65 8344 7681

My Car Consultant Pte Ltd
W: Myecar.sg | E: Admin@mycar.sg

60 Jalan Lam Huat, Carros Centre #05-21 S(737869)
UEN No.: 2016058787
GST Registration No.: 2016058787

From: "Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)" <chewht@lkkauto.com>
Sent: 1/11/23 11:27 AM
To: "admin@myecar.sg" <admin@mycar.sg>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>
Subject: SPAM-MED: RE: AIS REF: 2022 22004866SL/KC-SLK6830G - Appointment of PRI for SJJ3548X - DOA: 13.5.2022

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sirs,

As requested,
1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $3,156.50
2. Loss of Use (7days x $50.00) S 350.00
3. LTA/GIA Search Fee S 33.00
4. Towing Fee $ 70.00

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the
sole intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of
liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially
affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation
terms/settlement.”



Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
S(408933)

From: MY CAR CONSULTANT <admin@mycar.sg>
Sent: Thursday, 5 January 2023 4:34 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: AIS REF: 2022 22004866SL/KC-SLK6830G - Appointment of PRI for SJJ3548X - DOA: 13.5.2022

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sirs,

Please let us have breakdown on your offer

Best Regards,
Jackson

+65 8344 7681

My Car Consultant Pte Ltd
W: Mycar.sg | E: Admin@mycar.sg

60 Jalan Lam Huat, Carros Centre #05-21 S(737869)
UEN No.: 2016058787

GST Registration No.: 201605878Z

From: "Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)" <chewht@lkkauto.com>
Sent: 1/5/23 4:14 PM
To: My Car Consultant <admin@mycar.sg>
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: SPAM-LOW: RE: AIS REF: 2022 22004866SL/KC-SLK6830G - Appointment of PRI for SJJ3548X - DOA: 13.5.2022

3



Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs,

We propose settlement at a global sum of $3,600.00(all-in).

Please confirm acceptance.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the
sole intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of
liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially
affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation
terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
S(408933)

From: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>
Sent: Saturday, November 5, 2022 3:00 PM

To: Jeremy Yeo <admin@mycar.sg>
Cc: Chan, Kian Chuan (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <kianchuan.chan@allianz.sg>

Subject: AIS REF: 2022 22004866SL/KC-SLK6830G - Appointment of PRI for SJJ3548X - DOA: 13.5.2022

Internal



“Without Prejudice”
Dear Sir/Madam

Your Claim Ref: SJJ3548X

Our Claim Ref: 2022 22004866SL/KC-SLK6830G
We acknowledge receipt of your Letter of Demand dated 21 October 2022 received via email 1 November 2022.
Our claims specialist, Mr.KC is in the midst of reviewing your claim matter and will keep you informed once there is any update.

Should you require any clarification or assistance, please do not hesitate to contact our Claims Department at

claims@allianz.com.sg

Thank you.
Regards

Janice Koh
On behalf of Mr KC
Claims Specialist

Claims & Performance Management

Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. | UEN 201903913C

79 Robinson Road #09-01, Singapore 068897

www.allianz.sg

QQO | Altianz @) | (.~

Warldwide Olympic ond Perolymplc Portner

Please note: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential and / or privileged
information. If you are not the intended recipient, please do not read, copy, use or disclose the contents of this communication to others and notify
the sender immediately. Then please delete the e-mail and any copies of it. Thank you.

& Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail.



From: Jeremy Yeo <admin@mycar.sg>
Sent: 1 November, 2022 10:15 AM

To: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>; Yan (LKK Auto) <admin-d @lkkauto.com>
Subject: [EXT] Appointment of PRI for SJJ3548X 1 (Claim No: )2022 22004866SL-SLK6830G

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sirs,

Please refer to LOD and all supporting documents to assist in the closure of the case
swiftly.

Best Regards,
Jackson

+65 8344 7681

My Car Consultant Pte Ltd
W: Mycar.sg | E: Admin@mycar.sg

60 Jalan Lam Huat, Carros Centre #05-21 S(737869)
UEN No.: 2016058787
GST Registration No.: 201605878Z

From: "Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore)" <claims@allianz.com.sg>
Sent: 5/19/22 8:35 AM
To: "Yan (LKK Auto)" <admin-d @lkkauto.com>

Cc: Huiqin Tan <admin@mycar.sg>
Subject: Appointment of PRI for SJJ3548X 1 (Claim No: )2022 22004866SL-SLK6830G

Dear LKK

We are appointing your good office as the SJE for the PRI of SJJ3548X

Please download the documents from this link below:
File: 20220518- TP FNOL.msg

Link: _ https://filexchange.allianz.de/SecureDownload.aspx?id=de802a40-4fc5-4180-aa60-4b6¢fb918119-6acafdo83c6doec

Size: ~ 1 MByte, Download available until: 5/24/2022

Password will be sent in a separate email.



The service provider and/or its affiliates and their directors, employees, subcontractors and other persons acting on
their behalf shall not, directly or indirectly (e.g. via family members), offer or grant to Allianz and/or any Allianz
Affiliate or any of their employees, persons acting on their behalf or other third party concerned with the performance
of this agreement any benefit, be it monetary or other, that such recipient is not legally entitled to for the purpose of
obtaining any illegitimate advantage with regard to the conclusion or the performance of this agreement. The service
provider and/or its affiliates shall not commit, authorize or permit any action which would cause it or Allianz and/or
any Allianz Affiliate to be in violation of any applicable anti-bribery law or regulation in the performance of this
agreement. This obligation applies in particular to illegitimate payments to government officials or their associates,
families or close friends. The service provider shall promptly notify Allianz and the relevant Allianz Affiliate if it
becomes aware of any violation of this Article.

Thank you.

Shanti . R
Claims Service Team
Claims & Performance Management

Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte.Ltd. | UEN 201903913C
79 Robinson Road #09-01 Singapore 068897
Phone: +65 63958973 | www.allianz.sg

QQ% | Allianz @) | (.w

Warldwide Olympls gnd Paralymplc Portnar
Please note: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential and/or privileged
information. If you are not the intended recipient, please do not read, copy, use or disclose the contents of this communication to others and notify
the sender immediately. Then please delete the e-mail and any copies of it. Thank you.

& Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail.



