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Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

From: Liew Si Ming <LiewSiMing@goldbell.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 8 June 2023 6:21 PM

To: Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

Cc: Ramesh; Catherine Chong Kai Ling; Amencia A/P Albert Schweitze; SUR

Subject: RE: OD Survey assignment - SNM22D207812/C01/TANKL - Veh: XE 3031E - DOA: 

31/10/2022 

Hi Huey Yon, 

 

 

Cost of repair of $27,822.93 before excess $2,000.00 & GST with 7 days of repair, offer accepted. 

Thank You. 

 

 

 

Liew Si Ming | Assistant, Motor Claims Admin 

Goldbell Engineering Pte Ltd 

 

 

t:  | m:  | f:   

 
Distribution | Leasing | Financial Services | Tech-enabled Core | Venture Build | Investments | Accelerator 

 

  

From: Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Thursday, 8 June 2023 3:56 pm 

To: Liew Si Ming <LiewSiMing@goldbell.com.sg> 

Cc: Ramesh <Ramesh@goldbell.com.sg>; Catherine Chong Kai Ling <CatherineChongKL@goldbell.com.sg>; Amencia 

A/P Albert Schweitze <Amencia@goldbell.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: OD Survey assignment - SNM22D207812/C01/TANKL - Veh: XE 3031E - DOA: 31/10/2022  

 

Dear Si Ming, 

 

Without prejudice 
 

We will be advising our principal a cost of repair of $27,822.93 before excess $2,000.00 & GST with 7 days 

of repair , subject to their approval. 

 
Best Regards, 

Huey Yon | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants 

phone: 6256-3561 | email: hueyyon@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
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From: Liew Si Ming <LiewSiMing@goldbell.com.sg>  

Sent: Monday, May 29, 2023 10:16 AM 

To: Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Ramesh <Ramesh@goldbell.com.sg>; Catherine Chong Kai Ling <CatherineChongKL@goldbell.com.sg>; Amencia 

A/P Albert Schweitze <Amencia@goldbell.com.sg> 

Subject: RE: OD Survey assignment - SNM22D207812/C01/TANKL - Veh: XE 3031E - DOA: 31/10/2022  

 

Hi Huey Yon, 

 

 

Please kindly assist to finalise. 

Thank You. 

 

 

 

Liew Si Ming | Assistant, Motor Claims Admin 

Goldbell Engineering Pte Ltd 

 

 

t:  | m:  | f:   

 
Distribution | Leasing | Financial Services | Tech-enabled Core | Venture Build | Investments | Accelerator 

 

  

From: Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Friday, 26 May 2023 2:49 pm 

To: Liew Si Ming <LiewSiMing@goldbell.com.sg> 

Cc: Ramesh <Ramesh@goldbell.com.sg>; Catherine Chong Kai Ling <CatherineChongKL@goldbell.com.sg>; Amencia 

A/P Albert Schweitze <Amencia@goldbell.com.sg> 

Subject: RE: OD Survey assignment - SNM22D207812/C01/TANKL - Veh: XE 3031E - DOA: 31/10/2022  

 

Dear Sir/Mdm, 

 

Please proceed the supplementary as attached with our surveyor marking. 
 
Best Regards, 

Huey Yon | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants 

phone: 6256-3561 | email: hueyyon@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Liew Si Ming <LiewSiMing@goldbell.com.sg>  

Sent: Friday, May 26, 2023 11:06 AM 

To: Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Ramesh <Ramesh@goldbell.com.sg>; Catherine Chong Kai Ling <CatherineChongKL@goldbell.com.sg>; Amencia 

A/P Albert Schweitze <Amencia@goldbell.com.sg> 

Subject: RE: OD Survey assignment - SNM22D207812/C01/TANKL - Veh: XE 3031E - DOA: 31/10/2022  

 

Dear Officer, 
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Please kindly advise if supplementary DOOR CONTROL MODULE, RH has been approved. 

Thank You. 

 

 

 

Liew Si Ming | Assistant, Motor Claims Admin 

Goldbell Engineering Pte Ltd 

 

 

t:  | m:  | f:   

 
Distribution | Leasing | Financial Services | Tech-enabled Core | Venture Build | Investments | Accelerator 

 

  

From: Liew Si Ming  

Sent: Friday, 5 May 2023 9:17 am 

To: Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Ramesh <Ramesh@goldbell.com.sg>; Catherine Chong Kai Ling <CatherineChongKL@goldbell.com.sg> 

Subject: RE: OD Survey assignment - SNM22D207812/C01/TANKL - Veh: XE 3031E - DOA: 31/10/2022  

 

Hi Huey Yon, 

 

 

Photo of damaged part attached as per requested. 

Thank You. 

 

 

 

Liew Si Ming | Assistant, Motor Claims Admin 

Goldbell Engineering Pte Ltd 

 

 

t:  | m:  | f:   

 
Distribution | Leasing | Financial Services | Tech-enabled Core | Venture Build | Investments | Accelerator 

 

  

From: Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Thursday, 4 May 2023 3:37 pm 

To: Liew Si Ming <LiewSiMing@goldbell.com.sg> 

Cc: Ramesh <Ramesh@goldbell.com.sg>; Catherine Chong Kai Ling <CatherineChongKL@goldbell.com.sg> 

Subject: RE: OD Survey assignment - SNM22D207812/C01/TANKL - Veh: XE 3031E - DOA: 31/10/2022  
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Dear Si Ming, 

 

Kindly provide us the damaged and new photos for DOOR CONTROL MODULE, RH. 

 
Best Regards, 

Huey Yon | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants 

phone: 6256-3561 | email: hueyyon@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Liew Si Ming <LiewSiMing@goldbell.com.sg>  

Sent: Friday, April 28, 2023 9:49 AM 

To: Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Ramesh <Ramesh@goldbell.com.sg>; Catherine Chong Kai Ling <CatherineChongKL@goldbell.com.sg> 

Subject: RE: OD Survey assignment - SNM22D207812/C01/TANKL - Veh: XE 3031E - DOA: 31/10/2022  

 

Dear Officer, 

 

 

Please kindly advise if supplementary DOOR CONTROL MODULE, RH has been approved. 

Thank You. 

 

 

 

Liew Si Ming | Assistant, Motor Claims Admin 

Goldbell Engineering Pte Ltd 

 

 

t:  | m:  | f:   

 
Distribution | Leasing | Financial Services | Tech-enabled Core | Venture Build | Investments | Accelerator 

 

  

From: Liew Si Ming  

Sent: Wednesday, 5 April 2023 11:31 am 

To: 'Huey Yon (LKKAuto' <hueyyon@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Kon Yin Siew <KonYinSiew@goldbell.com.sg>; Ramesh <Ramesh@goldbell.com.sg>; Catherine Chong Kai Ling 

<CatherineChongKL@goldbell.com.sg> 

Subject: RE: OD Survey assignment - SNM22D207812/C01/TANKL - Veh: XE 3031E - DOA: 31/10/2022  

 

Dear Officer, 

 

 

Please kindly assist to arrange for supplementary and before paint survey tomorrow. 

Thank You. 
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Liew Si Ming | Assistant, Motor Claims Admin 

Goldbell Engineering Pte Ltd 

 

 

t:  | m:  | f:   

 
Distribution | Leasing | Financial Services | Tech-enabled Core | Venture Build | Investments | Accelerator 

 

  

From: Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Thursday, November 24, 2022 2:00 PM 

To: Kon Yin Siew <KonYinSiew@goldbell.com.sg>; liewsiming@goldbell.com; ramesh@goldbell.com; Catherine 

Chong Kai Ling <CatherineChongKL@goldbell.com.sg> 

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: OD Survey assignment - SNM22D207812/C01/TANKL - Veh: XE 3031E - DOA: 31/10/2022  

 

Dear Sir/Mdm, 

 

As instructed by our client , please proceed to repair the insured vehicle XE 3031E (Excess $2,000/-). 

 

If there are any check items or supplementary items please inform our office’s Assignment Team at Tel: 

6741 8434 to arrange our surveyor for inspection.  

 

All supplementary items and unconfirm items are subjected to further approval from insurance company 

before completion of the repair. 

 

*Our client reserve their rights not to pay if there is no valid approval obtained before repair. 
 

 
Best Regards, 

Huey Yon | case handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte.Ltd. 
Phone: 6256-3561  Fax: 62564315  email: hueyyon@lkkauto.com 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, Singapore 408933 

 


