Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: Koh, Janice (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <janice.koh@allianz.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 3 November 2022 10:42 PM

To: admin-d; assignments

Subject: RE: 2022 22007895_FR-GK-XE745Z - RE: SJK3074R CLAIMING AGAINST XE745Z
DOA:28.10.2022

Dear Survey Firm,
Please retrieved documents via Allianz FileXchange link below and create claim in Merimen accordingly.

Ol Non report as of today.
Ol Agent email: enquiry@allink.com.sg / allinkins@allink.com.sg

File: Cl.pdf, SJK3074R LTA SEARCH.pdf, SJK3074R GIA.pdf

Link: https://filexchange.allianz.de/SecureDownload.aspx?id=8e8d1677-bd58-40f7-alb7-e7939a9ded18-
28fc33461068b952

Size: ~ 5 MByte, Download available until: 11/10/2022

Password: Allianz1

Thank you

Janice Koh
Claims Specialist
Claims & Performance Management

Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. | UEN 201903913C
79 Robinson Road #09-01, Singapore 068897

www.allianz.sg

OQO | Allianz @) | (.o

Warldwides Olymplc ond Poralymplc Portner

Please note: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential and / or privileged
information. If you are not the intended recipient, please do not read, copy, use or disclose the contents of this communication to others and notify the
sender immediately. Then please delete the e-mail and any copies of it. Thank you.

&4 Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail.

From: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore)

Sent: 3 November, 2022 10:39 PM

To: sm automotive <sm_automotive@hotmail.com>

Cc: Yan (LKK Auto) <admin-d@Ikkauto.com>; assignments <assighments@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: 2022 22007895_FR-GK-XE745Z - RE: SJK3074R CLAIMING AGAINST XE745Z DOA:28.10.2022

Your ref: SJK3074R
Our ref: 2022 22007895FR/GK-XE745Z



Dear Sirs,
We hereby appoint our direct settlement partners LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd to conduct survey.
Kindly engage with them to arrange for survey.

Thank you.

Janice Koh
Claims Specialist
Claims & Performance Management

Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. | UEN 201903913C
79 Robinson Road #09-01, Singapore 068897

www.allianz.sg

OQL | Allianz @) | (.w

Warldwides Olymplc ond Poralymplc Portner

Please note: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential and / or privileged
information. If you are not the intended recipient, please do not read, copy, use or disclose the contents of this communication to others and notify the
sender immediately. Then please delete the e-mail and any copies of it. Thank you.

&4 Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail.

From: sm automotive <sm_automotive@hotmail.com>

Sent: 3 November, 2022 06:40 PM

To: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>

Subject: [EXT] Re: 2022 22007895 FR-GK-XE745 - RE: SJK3074R CLAIMING AGAINST XE745Z DOA:28.10.2022

Without Prejudice

Hi Janice

Thanks for your email.
Kindly arrange for

e LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Regards,

Sukyi Chong
SM AUTOMOTIVE

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6

Blk C #01-43

Singapore 417883

Tel: 6747 9241 Fax: 67417276



From: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, November 3, 2022 6:29 PM

To: sm automotive <sm automotive@hotmail.com>

Subject: AIS: 2022 22007895_FR-GK-XE745 - RE: SIK3074R CLAIMING AGAINST XE745Z DOA:28.10.2022

Internal

Your Ref: SJK3074R
Our Ref: 2022 22007895 FR-GK-XE745

Dear Sirs
Enclosed is the list of surveyors for your consideration for Single Joint Expert (SJE):-

e AJAX Inspection Services Pte Ltd

e A-PAC Adjusters & Surveyors Pte Ltd
e Form Team Consultancy Pte Ltd

e LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Please let us know who you are agreeable to appoint from the list.

Best regards,

Janice Koh
Claims Specialist
Claims & Performance Management

Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. | UEN 201903913C
79 Robinson Road #09-01, Singapore 068897

www.allianz.sg

OQL | Allianz @) | (.o

Warldwide Olympic ond Poralympic Portner
Please note: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential and / or privileged
information. If you are not the intended recipient, please do not read, copy, use or disclose the contents of this communication to others and notify the
sender immediately. Then please delete the e-mail and any copies of it. Thank you.
&4 Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail.

From: sm automotive <sm_automotive@hotmail.com>

Sent: 3 November, 2022 05:09 PM

To: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>
Subject: [EXT] Re: SJK3074R CLAIMING AGAINST XE745Z DOA:28.10.2022

Without Prejudice
Hi Janice

Enclosed GIA & LTA Search for your reference.



We look forward to hearing from you soon of the surveyor list, thanks.

Regards,

Sukyi Chong
SM AUTOMOTIVE

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6

Blk C #01-43

Singapore 417883

Tel: 6747 9241 Fax: 67417276

From: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>
Sent: Thursday, November 3, 2022 4:45 PM

To: sm automotive <sm automotive@hotmail.com>

Subject: RE: SJK3074R CLAIMING AGAINST XE745Z DOA:28.10.2022

Internal

Without Prejudice
Dear Sir/Madam
Kindly provide us your client GIA report and LTA search fee.

Should you require any clarification or assistance, please do not hesitate to contact our Claims Department
at claims@allianz.com.sg

Thank you.

Janice Koh
Claims Specialist
Claims & Performance Management

Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. | UEN 201903913C
79 Robinson Road #09-01, Singapore 068897

www.allianz.sg

OQL | Allianz @) | (.o

Warldwides Olymplc ond Porolymplc Portner
Please note: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential and / or privileged
information. If you are not the intended recipient, please do not read, copy, use or disclose the contents of this communication to others and notify the
sender immediately. Then please delete the e-mail and any copies of it. Thank you.
&4 Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail.

From: sm automotive <sm_automotive@hotmail.com>

Sent: 3 November, 2022 02:34 PM

To: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>
Subject: [EXT] SIK3074R CLAIMING AGAINST XE745Z DOA:28.10.2022

Without Prejudice

Hi Motor Claim Dept



Kindly send us your surveyor list, thanks.

Regards,

Sukyi Chong
SM AUTOMOTIVE

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6

Blk C #01-43

Singapore 417883

Tel: 6747 9241 Fax: 67417276



