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Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: Toh Boon Wah <bwtoh@boonsiewhonda.com.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, 30 November 2022 11:07 AM
To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: S2M04DWY -EXTERNAL] Accident involving FBP475E & SHC8598D along Pasir Ris 

Dr 1 on 28/10/2022 *** LKK REF: CC4/ASM22011010/Gpa3

Hi Mei Kwan, 
 
Attached towing receipt as per your request. 
It was issued and address to the owner of FBP475E. 
 
Regards, 
 
Toh BW 
Service Department 
 

 
Boon Siew S’pore Pte Ltd 
DID: 6513 9330 
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From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Friday, 25 November 2022 12:11 pm 
To: Toh Boon Wah <bwtoh@boonsiewhonda.com.sg> 
Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: S2M04DWY -EXTERNAL] Accident involving FBP475E & SHC8598D along Pasir Ris Dr 1 on 28/10/2022 *** 
LKK REF: CC4/ASM22011010/Gpa3  
 
CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the 
sender and know the content is safe. 

 
Dear Sir / Madam, 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
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As spoken, we would like to withdraw direct settlement for this case. 
 
The case is under investigation and we will update you by next week. 
 
Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Mei Kwan | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com  

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Friday, 25 November 2022 10:29 AM 
To: Toh Boon Wah <bwtoh@boonsiewhonda.com.sg> 
Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: S2M04DWY -EXTERNAL] Accident involving FBP475E & SHC8598D along Pasir Ris Dr 1 on 28/10/2022 *** 
LKK REF: CC4/ASM22011010/Gpa3  
 
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
 
Dear sirs, 
 
We refer to the above matter.   
 
Please be informed that basing on the accident statements submitted by both parties, the liability is clear / under BOLA 
(subject to BOLA guideline settlement) and shall proceed with direct settlement for the above-mentioned case. 
 
Please note that this e-mail is on without prejudice basis which does not amount to an authorisation of repair to your 
client’s vehicle and admission of any liability to our Insured’s part. The final repair cost is subjected to the consistency of 
the damages according to the nature of the accident. And the days of LOU/ LOR will be based on the number of days of 
repair as recommended by our surveyor and approved by our principal. 
 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the 
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this 
negotiation of terms/settlement. 
  
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of 
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
 

Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Mei Kwan | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com  

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Toh Boon Wah <bwtoh@boonsiewhonda.com.sg>  
Sent: Wednesday, 2 November 2022 4:07 PM 
To: SG AXA Insurance SM AXA SGP - Motor Survey <motor.survey@axa.com.sg> 
Subject: S2M04DWY -EXTERNAL] Accident involving FBP475E & SHC8598D along Pasir Ris Dr 1 on 28/10/2022 
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Dear Officer In Charge, 
 
We are the representing on behalf of our client on 3 rd party claim on property damage to his motorcycle 
FBP475E 
Attached with copy of Police Report / GIA Accident report, repair estimate and certificate of insurance for 
your perusal. 
 
Kindly instruct your surveyor to conduct a survey on the vehicle within the next two (2) days, failing which we 
shall appoint my own surveyor  
and claim for survey fee in addition to the other disbursements. 
 
Please be inform that the vehicle is currently laying at : 
 
Boon Siew Singapore Pte Ltd 
370 Ubi Road 
Singapore 408651 
Level 1 (Next to Cargo Lift Lobby) 
 
 
Regards, 
 
Toh BW 
Hp: 9112 1132 
Service Department 
 

 
Boon Siew S’pore Pte Ltd 
DID: 6513 9330 
 
 
 


