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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Sent: Tuesday, 22 November 2022 2:00 PM
To: 'raymond@bhh.com.sg'; stephanie@bhh.com.sg
Cc: Admin A; Marcus Chua (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: Accident Involving FBK6058M/ SMD8331S on 22 Oct 2022
Attachments: PRIVATE SETTLEMENT FORM_FBK6058M VS SMD8331S.pdf

Without Prejudice 
 
Dear Raymond, 
 
Attached is a copy of private settlement form for your reference. 
 
We will get our surveyor Marcus to pass you the payment of $590.00 by this week. 
 
Kindly assist to sign on the private settlement form and return to us(LKK) via email. Thanks. 
 
 
 

 
Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

 
 

From: raymond@bhh.com.sg <raymond@bhh.com.sg>  
Sent: Tuesday, 15 November 2022 3:29 PM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; stephanie@bhh.com.sg 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: Accident Involving FBK6058M/ SMD8331S on 22 Oct 2022 
 
Dear Hsiao Tong, 
 
We attached the third party vehicle for your perusal. 
 
Driver is Mr. Ong Beng Chong 
 
Please advise your insured liability for direct settlement. 
 
Thanks 

Best Regards, 
Raymond 
Ban Hock Hin Co., Pte Ltd 



2

Tel: (65) 6281 6520 x 220 | Fax: (65) 6284 2969 
Visit us at http://www.bhh.com.sg  
Facebook: http://www.facebook.com/bhhsg  
  
This mail and/or attachments are confidential and may also be legally privileged. If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any review, 
dissemination, distribution or copying of this email and/or attachments is strictly prohibited. Please notify us immediately by email and delete this message and 
all its attachments. 

  

 

 

  
 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, 8 November 2022 3:09 PM 
To: stephanie@bhh.com.sg 
Cc: raymond@bhh.com.sg; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: Accident Involving FBK6058M/ SMD8331S on 22 Oct 2022 
 
Without Prejudice 
 
Dear Sirs, 
 
Please be informed that we are pending for our insured GIA report from AXA. Therefore, we are unable to advise 
liability at this moment. 
 
We will follow up and get back to you. 
 
You may advise your client to claim OD if urgent. Thank you. 
 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 
from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
  
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
 
 

 
Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 
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From: stephanie@bhh.com.sg <stephanie@bhh.com.sg>  
Sent: Tuesday, 8 November 2022 11:10 AM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: stephanie@bhh.com.sg; raymond@bhh.com.sg 
Subject: RE: Accident Involving FBK6058M/ SMD8331S on 22 Oct 2022 
 
Dear Hsiao Tong, 
 
As requested by our client, please advise your insured liability as soon as possible. 
 
 
Thank you and have a great day! 
Please feel free to contact me if you have any questions. 
 
 
Stephanie Gan 
Retail Manager 
Tel: (65) 6281 6520 Ext 250 
Mobile: +65 9800 3299 
  
This mail and/or attachments are confidential and may also be legally privileged. If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any review, 
dissemination, distribution or copying of this email and/or attachments is strictly prohibited. Please notify us immediately by email and delete this message and 
all its attachments.  

 
 

From: raymond@bhh.com.sg <raymond@bhh.com.sg>  
Sent: Friday, 4 November 2022 1:42 pm 
To: 'Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)' <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: 'stephanie' <stephanie@bhh.com.sg> 
Subject: RE: Accident Involving FBK6058M/ SMD8331S on 22 Oct 2022 
 
Dear Hsiao Tong, 
 
As requested by our client, please advise your insured liability as soon as possible. 
 
Thanks 

Best Regards, 
Raymond 
Ban Hock Hin Co., Pte Ltd 
Tel: (65) 6281 6520 x 220 | Fax: (65) 6284 2969 
Visit us at http://www.bhh.com.sg  
Facebook: http://www.facebook.com/bhhsg  
  
This mail and/or attachments are confidential and may also be legally privileged. If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any review, 
dissemination, distribution or copying of this email and/or attachments is strictly prohibited. Please notify us immediately by email and delete this message and 
all its attachments. 
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From: raymond@bhh.com.sg <raymond@bhh.com.sg>  
Sent: Wednesday, 2 November 2022 2:26 PM 
To: 'Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)' <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: 'stephanie' <stephanie@bhh.com.sg> 
Subject: Accident Involving FBK6058M/ SMD8331S on 22 Oct 2022 
 
Hi Hsiao Tong, 
 
Mr. Marcus has surveyed our bike this afternoon. 
 
Appreciate for you to advise your insured liability for direct settlement. 
 
Thanks 

Best Regards, 
Raymond 
Ban Hock Hin Co., Pte Ltd 
Tel: (65) 6281 6520 x 220 | Fax: (65) 6284 2969 
Visit us at http://www.bhh.com.sg  
Facebook: http://www.facebook.com/bhhsg  
  
This mail and/or attachments are confidential and may also be legally privileged. If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any review, 
dissemination, distribution or copying of this email and/or attachments is strictly prohibited. Please notify us immediately by email and delete this message and 
all its attachments. 

  

 

 

  
 

From: stephanie@bhh.com.sg <stephanie@bhh.com.sg>  
Sent: Tuesday, 1 November 2022 9:18 AM 
To: motor.survey@axa.com.sg 
Cc: raymond@bhh.com.sg; stephanie@bhh.com.sg 
Subject: Accident Involving FBK6058M/ SMD8331S on 22 Oct 2022 
 
Dear Sir / Madam, 
 
We attached the 3rd party claim documents for your perusal. 
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Appreciate for you to arrange for the pre-repair survey. 
 
Thank you and have a great day! 
Please feel free to contact me if you have any questions. 
 
 
Stephanie Gan 
Retail Manager 
Tel: (65) 6281 6520 Ext 236 
Mobile: +65 9800 3299 
  
This mail and/or attachments are confidential and may also be legally privileged. If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any review, 
dissemination, distribution or copying of this email and/or attachments is strictly prohibited. Please notify us immediately by email and delete this message and 
all its attachments.  

 
 


