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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 4 November 2022 10:36 AM

To: SUR; KKH; sandrakhong@gmail.com

Subject: RE: YN 8868 R Estimate (Own Damage claim - veh towed in)

Dear Sandra, 

 

 

As instructed by our client , please proceed to repair the insured vehicle YN 8868R, Lump Sum Repair 

$27,000/-. (Excess $700/-). 

 

If there are any check items or supplementary items please inform our office’s Assignment Team at Tel: 

6741 8434 to arrange our surveyor for inspection.  

 

All supplementary items and unconfirm items are subjected to further approval from insurance company 

before completion of the repair. 

 

*Our client reserve their rights not to pay if there is no valid approval obtained before repair. 

 

 

 

 

Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

 

 

 

 

 

From: service@kkimhin.com.sg <service@kkimhin.com.sg>  

Sent: Tuesday, 1 November 2022 3:01 pm 

To: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 

Cc: service@kkimhin.com.sg; 'Sandra (Gmail)' <sandrakhong@gmail.com> 

Subject: YN 8868 R Estimate (Own Damage claim - veh towed in) 

  

Dear Officer 

  

Good day to you. 

 

Enclosed the estimate for YN 8868 R doing own damage claim. Date of accident: 5 Oct 2022. 
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Vehicle was towed from scene to traffic police on 5 Oct 2022.  

 

Vehicle was towed to our workshop from police compound on 26 Oct 2022 (paid by client). 

  

Please arrange for survey of the vehicle. Many thanks. 

  

Best Regards 

Sandra 

6452 7018 

9622 2116 

K. Kim Hin Auto Pte Ltd 

  


