Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 23 March 2023 11:14 AM
To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Subject: Fw: SMZ 3727B

CASE FINALISED

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

=] Save the Larth- Print only whenr necessary-

From: Winson Tan <winson_tingwei@hotmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, 23 March 2023 10:53 am

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: SMZ 3727B

Hi rasul, i hereby confirmed and agree the finalized offer amount.

Thank you

Best regards
Winson tan

Get Outlook for Android

From: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Thursday, March 23, 2023 10:45:04 AM

To: Winson Tan <winson_tingwei@hotmail.com>
Subject: SMZ 3727B

Hi Winson,
As per our message. We will be advising our principal a cost of repair L/S $9,050.00./- with 07 days of repair.

Kindly acknowledge

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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