TP DS claim: [EXT] RE: Arranging of Surveyor for Our Vehicle: SLP54T | Allianz
Ref: PC1044L

Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>
Mon 31/10/2022 1:47 PM

To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>;admin-d <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Internal

*VIRTUAL**

Please do not send emails/ letter or engage directly with our insured.
WP Survey, NO finalization.

Your ref: SLP54T
Our ref: 2022 22007762FR-PC1044L

Dear Sirs,

We hereby appoint our direct settlement partners to conduct survey.
Kindly engage with them to arrange for WP survey.

Ol NON REPORTING

Thank you.

Best regards,

Shanti. R

Claims Service

Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. | UEN 201903913C
79 Robinson Road #09-01 | Singapore 068897

Phone: +65 6395 3836 | www.allianz.sg

QQ | Allianz @) | (.

Worldwide Otympic ond Porolympic Portner

This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential and /
or privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient, please do not read, copy, use or disclose the contents of
this communication to others and notify the sender immediately. Then please delete the e-mail and any copies of it.
Thank you.

P Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail.

From: peoplevehicle @gmail.com <peoplevehicle @gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, October 31, 2022 11:45 AM

To: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>

Subject: [EXT] RE: Arranging of Surveyor for Our Vehicle: SLP54T | Allianz Ref: PC1044L


http://www.allianz.sg/

Dear Shanti,

We would like to appoint :-
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Regards,
Apple

People's Vehicle Recovery Service
Blk 3023A Ubi Road 1 #01-60 Singapore 408717
Main +65 6743 3246 | peoplevehicle@gmail.com | https://www.peoplesvehiclegroup.com

bIZSHFE,
This e-mail may contain confidential and privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient, please
notify the sender immediately and destroy this e-mail. Any unauthorised copying, disclosure or distribution of
material in this e-mail is strictly forbidden. The sender cannot guarantee that this communication is secure,
free of viruses, interceptions or interference. The sender does not accept liability for any errors or omissions.

From: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 28 October 2022 7:24 pm

To: peoplevehicle @gmail.com

Subject: FW: Arranging of Surveyor for Our Vehicle: SLP54T | Allianz Ref: PC1044L

Internal

Your ref: SLP54T
Our ref: 2022 22007762FR-PC1044L

Dear Sirs
Enclosed is the list of surveyors for your consideration for Single Joint Expert (SJE):-

AJAX Inspection Services Pte Ltd
A-PAC Adjusters & Surveyors Pte Ltd
Form Team Consultancy Pte Ltd
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Please let us know who you are agreeable to appoint from the list.

Best regards,

Shanti.R
Claims Service
Claims & Performance Management

Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte.Ltd. | UEN 201903913C
79 Robinson Road #09-01 Singapore 068897
Phone: +65 63958973 | www.allianz.sg


mailto:peoplevehicle@gmail.com
https://www.peoplesvehiclegroup.com/
https://www.facebook.com/PeoplesVehicleRecoveryService
https://wa.me/6588764671
http://www.allianz.sg/
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Please note: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and
may contain confidential and/or privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient, please do
not read, copy, use or disclose the contents of this communication to others and notify the sender
immediately. Then please delete the e-mail and any copies of it. Thank you.

Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail.

From: peoplevehicle @gmail.com <peoplevehicle @gmail.com>

Sent: Friday, October 28, 2022 4:29 PM

To: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>

Subject: [EXT] Arranging of Surveyor for Our Vehicle: SLP54T | Allianz Ref: PC1044L

Dear Team,
Find attached documents for your attention.
Thank you.

Regards,
Apple

People's Vehicle Recovery Service
Blk 3023A Ubi Road 1 #01-60 Singapore 408717
Main +65 6743 3246 | peoplevehicle @gmail.com | https://www.peoplesvehiclegroup.com

DIAFE,
This e-mail may contain confidential and privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient, please
notify the sender immediately and destroy this e-mail. Any unauthorised copying, disclosure or distribution of
material in this e-mail is strictly forbidden. The sender cannot guarantee that this communication is secure,
free of viruses, interceptions or interference. The sender does not accept liability for any errors or omissions.
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