
FW: PRI FOR SMS 243L ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKR 6745U ON 27.10.2022 OUR
REF: CL/221043/T/HH

Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>

Mon 31/10/2022 9B16 AM

To: admin-d <admin-d@lkkauto.com>;Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Internal

OI NON REPORTING –
 
FLEXIBLE GROUP PTE. LTD.
SGP-651441 Singapore, 441A BUKIT BATOK WEST AVENUE 8 /55006060
Thanks
Shanti
 
From: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) 
Sent: Monday, October 31, 2022 9:03 AM
To: info <info@catherinelimllc.com>; Yan (LKK Auto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>; Yan (LKK Auto)
<admin-d@lkkauto.com>
Subject: FW: PRI FOR SMS 243L ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKR 6745U ON 27.10.2022 OUR
REF: CL/221043/T/HH
 
WITHOUT PREJUDICE
 

 Your ref:  SMS243L

Our ref: 2022 22007756FR-SKR6754U

 

Dear Sir,

 

Please note that we are not agreeable with your proposed list for Single Joint Expert (SJE).

 
As such, we will proceed to appoint our surveyor to conduct a pre-repair survey of your

client s̓ vehicle (as per s. 2.9 of the NIMA Protocol).

 

We wish to highlight that under the Protocol, the PRS includes survey of dismantled parts

prior to repairs (as per s. 2.2 of the NIMA Protocol).

 

Please also note that we intend to conduct a post-repair survey immediately after repairs

before the vehicle is returned to your client (as per s. 2.11 of the NIMA Protocol).

 

We have appointed LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd   as our Single Joint Expert (SJE).
 

Best regards,

 
Shanti.R
Claims Service
Claims & Performance Management
 
Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte.Ltd. | UEN 201903913C
79 Robinson Road #09-01 Singapore 068897
Phone: +65 63958973 | www.allianz.sg
 
 

http://www.allianz.sg/
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P Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail.
 
From: info <info@catherinelimllc.com> 
Sent: Monday, October 31, 2022 8:27 AM
To: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>
Subject: [EXT] RE: PRI FOR SMS 243L ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKR 6745U ON 27.10.2022
OUR REF: CL/221043/T/HH
 

Internal

 
Dear Sirs (Without Prejudice)

We refer to your email.
 
Our client is not agreeable to your list of surveyors and wish to appoint Kelvin. Thank you.
 
Regards
Sally Goh
(For and on behalf of Catherine Lim )
Catherine Lim LLC
(Advocates & Solicitors)
12 Eu Tong Sen Street
#05-172 The Central (SOHO 2)
Singapore 059819
Tel: 6438 5500
(UEN No. 201310922K & GST Registration No: 201310922K)
 
 
 
From: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg> 
Sent: Saturday, 29 October 2022 12:23 pm
To: info <info@catherinelimllc.com>
Subject: FW: PRI FOR SMS 243L ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKR 6745U ON 27.10.2022 OUR
REF: CL/221043/T/HH
 

Internal

 
Your ref:  SMS243L

Our ref: 2022 22007756FR-SKR6754U

 

 

 Dear Sirs

 

Enclosed is the list of surveyors for your consideration for Single Joint Expert (SJE):-

 

AJAX Inspection Services Pte Ltd

mailto:info@catherinelimllc.com
mailto:claims@allianz.com.sg
mailto:claims@allianz.com.sg
mailto:info@catherinelimllc.com


A-PAC Adjusters & Surveyors Pte Ltd

Form Team  Consultancy  Pte Ltd

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd   

 

 Please let us know who you are agreeable to appoint from the list.

 

 

Best regards,

 

Shanti.R

Claims Service

Claims & Performance Management

 

Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte.Ltd. | UEN 201903913C

79 Robinson Road #09-01 Singapore 068897

Phone: +65 63958973 | www.allianz.sg

 

 

Please note: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients

and may contain confidential and/or privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient,

please do not read, copy, use or disclose the contents of this communication to others and notify

the sender immediately. Then please delete the e-mail and any copies of it. Thank you.

 

Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail.

From: info <info@catherinelimllc.com> 
Sent: Friday, October 28, 2022 1:22 PM
To: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>
Subject: [EXT] RE: PRI FOR SMS 243L ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKR 6745U ON 27.10.2022
OUR REF: CL/221043/T/HH
 

Internal

 
Dear Sir (Without Prejudice)
 
Please find attached GIA report.
Thank you.
 
Regards
Sally Goh
(For and on behalf of Catherine Lim )
Catherine Lim LLC
(Advocates & Solicitors)
12 Eu Tong Sen Street
#05-172 The Central (SOHO 2)
Singapore 059819
Tel: 6438 5500
(UEN No. 201310922K & GST Registration No: 201310922K)
 
 
 
From: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg> 
Sent: Friday, 28 October 2022 12:22 pm
To: info <info@catherinelimllc.com>

http://www.allianz.sg/
mailto:info@catherinelimllc.com
mailto:claims@allianz.com.sg
mailto:claims@allianz.com.sg
mailto:info@catherinelimllc.com


Subject: RE: PRI FOR SMS 243L ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKR 6745U ON 27.10.2022 OUR
REF: CL/221043/T/HH
 

Internal

 
Without Prejudice
 

Dear Sir/Madam

 

Kindly provide us the GIA report to register claim .

 

Thank you.

 

Should you require any clarification or assistance, please do not hesitate to contact our

Claims Department at claims@allianz.com.sg

 

 

Best regards,
 

 
Shanti. R
Claims Service
Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. | UEN 201903913C
79 Robinson Road #09-01 I Singapore 068897
Phone: +65 6395 3836 | www.allianz.sg
 
  

 
    This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential and / 

    or privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient, please do not read, copy, use or disclose the contents of

    this communication to others and notify the sender immediately. Then please delete the e-mail and any copies of it.  

    Thank you.
 
From: info <info@catherinelimllc.com> 
Sent: Friday, October 28, 2022 11:48 AM
To: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>
Subject: [EXT] PRI FOR SMS 243L ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKR 6745U ON 27.10.2022 OUR
REF: CL/221043/T/HH
 

Dear Sir

RE: NOTICE TO CONDUCT PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION WITHIN 2
WORKING DAYS PURSUANT TO PRE-ACTION PROTOCOL FOR NON-
INJURY MOTOR ACCIDENT CLAIMS (NIMA)

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMS 243L / SKR 6745U ON 27.10.2022 ALONG
SLE TOWARDS CITY
We are instructed by HUA HONG PTE LTD to notify you of a road traffic accident
involving our client’s vehicle No. SMS 243L and vehicle No. SKR 6745U driven

mailto:claims@allianz.com.sg
http://www.allianz.sg/
mailto:info@catherinelimllc.com
mailto:claims@allianz.com.sg


by your insured at the material time.
As a result of the accident, our client’s motor vehicle has been damaged. Before
our client proceed to repair the damaged motor vehicle, please let us know within 2
working days of your receipt of this notice whether you/your insurer would like to
conduct a pre-repair survey of the motor vehicle. If we do not receive any reply
from you/your insurer within the stipulated timeline, our client shall proceed to
repair the vehicle without further reference to you.

Please let us know your appointed surveyor.

Venue:             8 Kaki Bukit Ave 4, Premier@Kaki Bukit

#06-31 Singapore 415875             

Contact:              6661 9687   

 
Regards
Sally Goh
(For and on behalf of Catherine Lim )
Catherine Lim LLC
(Advocates & Solicitors)
12 Eu Tong Sen Street
#05-172 The Central (SOHO 2)
Singapore 059819
Tel: 6438 5500
(UEN No. 201310922K & GST Registration No: 201310922K)
 
 
Regards
Sally Goh
(For and on behalf of Catherine Lim )
Catherine Lim LLC
(Advocates & Solicitors)
12 Eu Tong Sen Street
#05-172 The Central (SOHO 2)
Singapore 059819
Tel: 6438 5500
(UEN No. 201310922K & GST Registration No: 201310922K)
 


