Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: claim.autoworxhouse@gmail.com

Sent: Tuesday, 20 June 2023 12:15 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Cc: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto); SUR

Subject: RE: Request Finalisation for SDR 3338 P TOYOTA WISH DOA 30102022
Hi,

We shall accept the propose.

Thank you.

Best regards,

Admin team

Autoworx House

No0.176 Sin Ming Drive

#02-01 Singapore 575721
claims.autoworxhouse@gmail.com
Tel: 64528211

Fax: 64517423

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 20 June 2023 9:20 am

To: claim.autoworxhouse@gmail.com

Cc: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Request Finalisation for SDR 3338 P TOYOTA WISH DOA 30102022

Dear Sir,

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Surveyor has review the no. of days again, maximum of 21 repair days (subject to insurance approval).

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)
Sent: Monday, June 19, 2023 2:02 PM



To: claim.autoworxhouse@gmail.com
Cc: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@Ilkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Request Finalisation for SDR 3338 P TOYOTA WISH DOA 30102022

Dear Sir,

Any update.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, June 12, 2023 9:55 AM

To: claim.autoworxhouse@gmail.com

Cc: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@Ilkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Request Finalisation for SDR 3338 P TOYOTA WISH DOA 30102022

Dear Sir,

We have check with surveyor, maximum of 18 repair days (subject to insurance approval).

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: claim.autoworxhouse@gmail.com <claim.autoworxhouse@gmail.com>

Sent: Friday, June 9, 2023 3:54 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@Ilkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Request Finalisation for SDR 3338 P TOYOTA WISH DOA 30102022

Hi,

We shall accept the offer amount, but we need at least 24 repair days to cover for the 32 days period in the
workshop.

Thank you.



Best regards,

Admin team

Autoworx House

No0.176 Sin Ming Drive

#02-01 Singapore 575721
claims.autoworxhouse@gmail.com
Tel: 64528211

Fax: 64517423

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, 9 June 2023 11:11 am

To: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@lkkauto.com>; claim.autoworxhouse @gmail.com; SUR
<sur@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Request Finalisation for SDR 3338 P TOYOTA WISH DOA 30102022

Dear Sir,

“Without Prejudice”

We will be advising our Principal a cost of repair of LS $23,800/- with 14 days of repair, subject to their
approval.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@I|kkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, June 7, 2023 2:58 PM

To: SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: FW: Request Finalisation for SDR 3338 P TOYOTA WISH DOA 30102022

Hi fyi.
CS/INC22010841/Kvy3

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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From: claim.autoworxhouse@gmail.com <claim.autoworxhouse@gmail.com>
Sent: Wednesday, June 7, 2023 2:56 PM

To: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Request Finalisation for SDR 3338 P TOYOTA WISH DOA 30102022

Dear Kenneth,
We are requesting for the following items to finalise the matter.

1. Front engine cross member - IMG 0147

2. Windscreen washer tank & Windscreen washer tank motor  -IMG 1198/ IMG 1032 / IMG 1033/ IMG
1034

3. Front bumper lower grille side (Parts were missing at the time of the accident)

4. Alternator — IMG 1022 (supplementary)

Besides can we request for increase the labour charge for ‘To remove and replace all the parts mentioned above,

knocking and straighten up the necessary affected areas.” To $2,000.00 and finalise at Lump Sum $24,900.00 .
Best regards,

Admin Team
Autoworx House
No0.176 Sin Ming Drive

#02-01 Singapore 575721
Tel: 96725547 / 98634184
Fax: 64517423

From: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@I|kkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 23 May 2023 8:21 am

To: claim.autoworxhouse@gmail.com

Subject: Re: Request Finalisation for SDR 3338 P TOYOTA WISH DOA 30102022

Attach finalise for SDR 3338P, please check and confirm. Final amount subject to insurance approval
thanks.

From: claim.autoworxhouse@gmail.com <claim.autoworxhouse@gmail.com>
Sent: Thursday, 9 March 2023 3:07 pm

To: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: FW: Request Finalisation for SDR 3338 P TOYOTA WISH DOA 30102022

REMINDER

From: claim.autoworxhouse@gmail.com <claim.autoworxhouse@gmail.com>
Sent: Thursday, 22 December 2022 10:50 am




To: 'Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto)' <KennethKong@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: Request Finalisation for SDR 3338 P TOYOTA WISH DOA 30102022

Dear Kenneth,

Are we able to finalise this case?

Thank you.

Best regards,

Admin Team
Autoworx House
No0.176 Sin Ming Drive

#02-01 Singapore 575721
Tel: 96725547 / 98634184
Fax: 64517423



