
TPPD survey: Claim ref: C10018319/JT || OI-SLZ9275K (GREY) TP-SME273Z ||
Est: $0.00 || BCC Automotive Pte Ltd

Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>
Mon 31/10/2022 2<47 PM

To: admin-d <admin-d@lkkauto.com>;SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>;assignments
<assignments@lkkauto.com>
Cc: Jason Tea Chee Kiat <jason.tea@budgetdirect.com.sg>;Derrick Quok
<derrick.q@budgetdirect.com.sg>;Kenneth Lim <kenneth.lim@budgetdirect.com.sg>

1 attachments (2 MB)
C10018319.zip;

Hi Team
 
We wish to appoint LKK to conduct survey for the TP vehicle number: SME273Z

Please kindly take note that the officer in-charge is Mr. @Jason Tea Chee
Kiat, who is copied in the email. We appreciate if you can keep him in the
loop.
 
BCC Automotive Pte Ltd (HQ)
Blk 1 Sin Ming Industrial Estate Sector C, #01-101/103/105 S575636
T :  65 6552 5588    Christina LIM

Please find attached GIA reports for your reference.
 
Thank you.
Best regards,
 
Maybie Chua
Admin Executive, Claims
 
F +65 6725 0853 
E maybie.chua@budgetdirect.com.sg

 

 
From: Christina Lim <christina@bcc.sg> 
Sent: Monday, 31 October 2022 9:59 am
To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>
Cc: Charandeep Singh <charandeep.s@budgetdirect.com.sg>; karseng@bcc.sg;
francis@bcc.sg
Subject: RE: PRI Request on 28.10.2022 || Ourf: C10018319/CD || 3RD PARTY CLAIM AGAIN
SLZ9275K, INVOLVING VEHICLE NO SME273Z
 
Hi,
 

mailto:jason.tea@budgetdirect.com.sg
mailto:maybie.chua@budgetdirect.com.sg


Please engage LKK.                        
 
Best Regards
 
Christina LIM
______________________________________________
POINT S SINGAPORE (Master Franchise)
 
BCC Automotive Pte Ltd (HQ)
Blk 1 Sin Ming Industrial Estate Sector C, #01-101/103/105 S575636
T :  65 6552 5588     F : 65 6552 7750   
 

50 Old Toh Tuck Road, S(597657), Cynergy Gas Station  T: 6468 5588
255 Paya Lebar Road S(409037), SHELL AutoServ T: 6702 5588

 

Operating Hours : Mon - Fri (8:30am - 5:30pm)   |   Sat (8:30am - 4:00pm)   |   Closed on Sun and Public Holidays

 
From: Christina Lim <christina@bcc.sg> 
Sent: Friday, 28 October 2022 12:34 pm
To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>
Cc: karseng@bcc.sg; francis@bcc.sg
Subject: 3RD PARTY CLAIM AGAIN SLZ9275K, INVOLVING VEHICLE NO SME273Z
 
Hi office in charge,
 
Your insured’s vehicle no.SLZ9275K has collided against our client’s vehicle no. SME273Z on
the 28 October 2022.
We are proposing for an amicable settlement, please help to check officer in charge & arrange
surveyor to inspect the vehicle soonest possible.
Accident report attached for your easy reference. (password: SME273Z6073E)
 
Best Regards
 
Christina LIM
_______________________________________________
POINT S SINGAPORE (Master Franchise)
 
BCC Automotive Pte Ltd (HQ)
Blk 1 Sin Ming Industrial Estate Sector C, #01-101/103/105 S575636
T :  65 6552 5588     F : 65 6552 7750   
www.bcc.sg
 

 

50 Old Toh Tuck Road, S(597657), Cynergy Gas Station  T: 6468 5588
255 Paya Lebar Road S(409037), SHELL AutoServ T: 6702 5588

 

Operating Hours : Mon - Fri (8:30am - 5:30pm)   |   Sat (8:30am - 4:00pm)   |   Closed on Sun and Public Holidays

 
 

mailto:christina@bcc.sg
mailto:claims@budgetdirect.com.sg
mailto:karseng@bcc.sg
mailto:francis@bcc.sg
https://apc01.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=http%3A%2F%2Fwww.bcc.sg%2F&data=05%7C01%7Cclaims%40budgetdirect.com.sg%7Cbc881a635bb74d1b4d6208dabae38721%7C30481a8fb7224e2f8cfe9fd64ae30761%7C1%7C0%7C638027783662171220%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJWIjoiMC4wLjAwMDAiLCJQIjoiV2luMzIiLCJBTiI6Ik1haWwiLCJXVCI6Mn0%3D%7C3000%7C%7C%7C&sdata=yMKn9k8kZVEy5zdUMjOPzV1BldIVW7l4zlrOH7XYrPc%3D&reserved=0

