EzLyna (LKKAuto)

From: Hisham Danial <danialhishams@icloud.com>

Sent: Monday, 14 November 2022 12:18 PM

To: EzLyna (LKKAuto)

Cc: hi sham

Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJG746B (CHINA TAIPING) AND SMM7489E AT/ALONG PIE

TOWARDS TUAS BEFORE EXIT 36 ON 28/10/2022

Dear Ezlyna,
Thank you for the call earlier today.
We refer to the email vide below by LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (“LKK”) on 14 November 2022.

We summarise the salient points of our discussions over the call as follows:
1. We wish to dispute the liability and by the same token, the grounds underpinning the liability of the accident.
2. LKK has kindly agreed to hold on the settlement negotiations with the claimant pending discussions between
the insured and China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd (the “Insurer”).
Point 1 will be pursued separately by engaging the Insurer and any updates will be duly forwarded to LKK at appropriate
junctures as may be determined by us or the Insurer.

Separately, we look forward to hearing more from you when the senior staff mentioned is back.

Best regards,
Danial Hisham

On 14 Nov 2022, at 08:56, EzLyna (LKKAuto) <ezlyna@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Our Ref: CC6/CTI22010771/Upa3

Insured Name : Hishamuddin Bin Mohammad Zakaria
Insured Driver : Mohammad Danial Bin Hishamuddin

Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJG746B (CHINA TAIPING) AND SMM7489E AT/ALONG PIE
TOWARDS TUAS BEFORE EXIT 36 ON 28/10/2022

We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster
appointed by your motor insurer, China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd to deal with the
third party claim against your policy.

We have received a claim from SMM7489E against your motor insurance policy.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, we are of the view that liability is not in your
driver’s favour. Therefore, we shall proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement of the third
party claim at best to avoid further litigation, which would escalate to even more cost.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement,
please contact us within 07 days from the date of this letter.
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Thank you.

Best Regards,

Ezlyna Eng | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6841-6051 | email: Ezlyna@Ilkkauto.com |

Bk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)




