11/13/22, 2:53 PM

Re: SNM22D207786 /C02/GBK9969P/KHONGLH/ RE: Direct Settlement - Accident
Involving GBK9969P (OI) and SCX9699M (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CTI22010751/pa3) on

28/10/2022

Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>
Sun 13/11/2022 2:53 PM

To: Lynn Khong <lynn.khong@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>;CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>;Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

<chewht@lkkauto.com>

[I]J 3 attachments (2 MB)
TP ESTIMATE - MARKED.pdf; TP - IA.pdf; LKK SURVEY PHOTO.pdf;

Dear Lynn,
We refer to the above matter.

Enclosed for your perusal is:
- TP estimated cost of repair
- Preliminary advice
- Photographs of TP vehicle in its damaged condition

Please share a copy of insured video footage for our viewing.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>
Sent: Monday, 7 November 2022 4:55 pm
To: Lynn Khong <lynn.khong@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>; Claims Dept of CTI

<claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Subject: RE: SNM22D207786 /C02/GBK9969P/KHONGLH/ RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBK9969P

(Ol) and SCX9699M (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CTI22010751/pa3) on 28/10/2022

Dear Lynn,
Please share a copy of insured video footage for our viewing.

Thanks.

Best Regards,

https://outlook.office.com/mail/deeplink?popoutv2=1&version=20221104009.06 &view=print
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11/13/22, 2:53 PM Mail - Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) - Outlook
Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |
HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, 7 November 2022 3:46 PM

To: Lynn Khong <lynn.khong@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-
a@lkkauto.com>; Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Subject: Re: SNM22D207786 /C02/GBK9969P/KHONGLH/ RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBK9969P
(Ol) and SCX9699M (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CTI122010751/pa3) on 28/10/2022

Dear Lynn,

Please see attached TP video.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Lynn Khong <lynn.khong@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Monday, 31 October 2022 2:47 pm

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@I|kkauto.com>

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-
a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: SNM22D207786 /C02/GBK9969P/KHONGLH/ RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBK9969P (Ol)
and SCX9699M (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CTI122010751/pa3) on 28/10/2022
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