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Meng Yan (LKK Auto)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>
Sent: Thursday, 27 October 2022 4:37 PM
To: assignments
Cc: MT_Claim_SG
Subject: FW: Your Ref: Your Insured (GBF 380Y); Our Ref:  RA.519186.J  DOA: 18.07.2022
Attachments: TP SURVEY REPORT.pdf; 1st page.pdf

Lonpac External - General 
 
 
 
Best Regards 
 
Gerald Poh 
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road, #17-04/06 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 
 
 
 

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt 
practices. 

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>  
Sent: Thursday, 27 October 2022 4:32 pm 
To: 'assignments' <assignments@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; riaz@justice.com.sg 
Subject: FW: Your Ref: Your Insured (GBF 380Y); Our Ref: RA.519186.J DOA: 18.07.2022 
 

Lonpac External - General 
 
Our Ref : 22/22/22/VC05/026047 
 
Dear Yan, 
 
Please arrange for a re-inspection of the third party vehicle on the date and location stated 
below. 
 
At the same time, please confirm the appointment with the third party’s solicitors. 
 
 
 
Best Regards 
 
Gerald Poh 
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road, #17-04/06 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 
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We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt 
practices. 

From: Sherlyn <riaz@justice.com.sg>  
Sent: Thursday, 27 October 2022 4:19 pm 
To: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com> 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 
Subject: RE: Your Ref: Your Insured (GBF 380Y); Our Ref: RA.519186.J DOA: 18.07.2022 
 
Dear Gerald, 
 
We refer to your email below. 
 
Our client’s vehicle is available for re-inspection on Monday, 31 October 2022 @11:00 a.m.  
 
Workshop address: 10 Kaki Bukit Road 2 #01-34 Singapore 417868 
 
Kindly confirm the appointment urgently. 
 
Regards, 
Sherlyn 
Paralegal to Mr. Muhammad Ridhwan  
RIAZ LLC 
133 New Bridge Road 
#09-09 Chinatown Point 
Singapore 059413 
Tel : (65) 65340110 
Fax : (65) 65340220 
 
Disclaimer: This message is privileged and confidential and is intended solely for the named recipient. If you are not 
the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any dissemination or copying of this communication is strictly 
prohibited. If this e-mail has reached you in error, please delete the e-mail immediately and inform us of the error by 
sending an e-mail to riaz@justice.com.sg. though internet communications cannot be guaranteed to be secure or error-
free as information could be intercepted, corrupted, lost or infected with viruses, we have scanned this message to 
minimise the possibility of corruption.  
 

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>  
Sent: Thursday, October 27, 2022 4:01 PM 
To: Sherlyn <riaz@justice.com.sg> 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 
Subject: RE: Your Ref: Your Insured (GBF 380Y); Our Ref: RA.519186.J DOA: 18.07.2022 
 

Lonpac External - General 
 
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
 
Dear Sherlyn, 
 
As spoken, we await the date of reinspection. 
 
Best Regards 
 
Gerald Poh 
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road, #17-04/06 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 
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We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt 
practices. 

From: Sherlyn <riaz@justice.com.sg>  
Sent: Thursday, 27 October 2022 3:31 pm 
To: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com> 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 
Subject: RE: Your Ref: Your Insured (GBF 380Y); Our Ref: RA.519186.J DOA: 18.07.2022 
 
Dear Gerald, 
 
We refer to the above matter and your email dated 19 October 2022. 
 
Kindly let us have a copy of your inspection report. 
 
Regards, 
Sherlyn 
Paralegal to Mr. Muhammad Ridhwan  
RIAZ LLC 
133 New Bridge Road 
#09-09 Chinatown Point 
Singapore 059413 
Tel : (65) 65340110 
Fax : (65) 65340220 
 
Disclaimer: This message is privileged and confidential and is intended solely for the named recipient. If you are not 
the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any dissemination or copying of this communication is strictly 
prohibited. If this e-mail has reached you in error, please delete the e-mail immediately and inform us of the error by 
sending an e-mail to riaz@justice.com.sg. though internet communications cannot be guaranteed to be secure or error-
free as information could be intercepted, corrupted, lost or infected with viruses, we have scanned this message to 
minimise the possibility of corruption.  
 

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, October 19, 2022 10:11 AM 
To: riaz@justice.com.sg 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 
Subject: FW: Your Ref: Your Insured (GBF 380Y); Our Ref: RA.519186.L(Z) DOA: 18.07.2022 
 

Lonpac External - General 
 
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
 
Dear Jie Si, 
 
As you have not revert on the date of reinspection, we propose to make an offer for the 
injury claim 
which are as follows :- 
 
General Damages            $800.00 
Special Damages             $206.56 
Disbursements                $152.59 
Costs                              $1,605.00 (with GST) 
                                      ------------ 
                                      $2,764.15 
                                      ------------  
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Best Regards 
 
Gerald Poh 
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road, #17-04/06 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 
 
 
 

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt 
practices. 

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>  
Sent: Thursday, 29 September 2022 8:56 am 
To: Jie Si <riaz@justice.com.sg> 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 
Subject: RE: Your Ref: Your Insured (GBF 380Y); Our Ref: RA.519186.L(Z) DOA: 18.07.2022 
 

Lonpac External - General 
 
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
SAVE AS TO COSTS 
 
Our Ref: 22/22/22/VC05/026047 
 
Dear Jie Si, 
 
We acknowledged receipt of your LOD. 
 
We are of the view that the repair cost is excessive and wish to call for a re-inspection. 
 
Please arrange 10 days in advance a suitable date, time and location so that a re-inspection 
can be conducted. 
 
 
 
Best Regards 
 
Gerald Poh 
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road, #17-04/06 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 
 
 
 

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt 
practices. 

From: Jie Si <riaz@justice.com.sg>  
Sent: Wednesday, 28 September 2022 5:29 pm 
To: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 
Subject: Your Ref: Your Insured (GBF 380Y); Our Ref: RA.519186.L(Z) DOA: 18.07.2022 
 
WITHOUT PREJUDICE  
 
Dear Sir / Madam,   
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ACCIDENT INVOLVING MOTOR VEHICLE GBH 9503R AND GBF 380Y ON 18TH JULY 2022 ALONG 
TAMPINES AVENUE 10 
 
We refer to the above mentioned caption, which we act for the owner and driver of motor vehicle no. GBH 9503R. 
 
Please find the enclosed letter of demand and supporting documents for your immediate attention. 
 
Please note that pursuant to the State Court’s Protocol for Motor Accident cases, you are required to acknowledge 
receipt of a letter of demand within 14 days of its receipt.   
 
Should you failed to acknowledge within the next 14 days hereof, our client may commence legal proceeding against 
your insured / insured driver without further reference to you. 
 
Thanks & Best Regards, 
 
Jie Si 
RIAZ LLC  
Advocates and Solicitors 
133 NEW BRIDGE ROAD  
# 09-09 CHINATOWN POINT 
SINGAPORE 059413 
TEL  : 6534-0110   FAX : 6534-0220 
  

------------------------------------------------------- 
Disclaimer: This message is privileged and confidential and is intended solely for the named recipient. If you are not the intended recipient, 
you are hereby notified that any dissemination or copying of this communication is strictly prohibited. If this e-mail has reached you in error, 
please delete the e-mail immediately and inform us of the error by sending an e-mail to riaz@justice.com.sg. though internet communications 
cannot be guaranteed to be secure or error-free as information could be intercepted, corrupted, lost or infected with viruses, we have 
scanned this message to minimise the possibility of corruption.  
------------------------------------------------------- 

 


