Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

From: Revo Performance <revoperformance@hotmail.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 3 January 2023 6:09 PM

To: Finalization

Cc: Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: SJG7627R - Finalize

Dear Sir,

We accept the final COR in $4800.00 (L/S, before GST), 6 days.

Thanks & Regards

Joey Chong

Revo Performance Pte Ltd

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 #02-51 & 53 Singapore 417883 (Autobay@KakiBukit)
Tel: (65) 6745 6706

Fax: (65) 6484 3653

www.revoperformance.com.sg

Think Green - Please consider your environmental responsibility before printing this email.

NOTE: This message is from Revo Performance Pte Ltd and may contain confidential business information. It is intended solely for the use of the individual to whom it is addressed. If you are not the intended recipient (or responsible for delivery of the
message to such person), you may not copy or deliver this message to anyone. Kindly notify the sender and please delete this message and any attachment from your system. All opinions, conclusions and other information expressed in this message not
of an official nature shall not be deemed as given or endorsed by Revo Performance Pte Ltd or any of its subsidiaries unless otherwise indicated by an authorised representative independent of this message.

Revo Performance Pte Ltd

Reg No. 201200256H

From: Finalization <finalization@Ilkkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, January 3, 2023 2:35 AM

To: Revo Performance <revoperformance@hotmail.com>
Cc: Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: SIG7627R - Finalize

Hi Joey,

We will be advising our principal for the costs of repairs in $4800.00 (L/S, before GST), 6 days. Subject to their approval.

Thanks.



Best Regards,

case handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte.Ltd.

Phone: 6256-3561 Fax: 62564315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, Singapore 408933

From: Revo Performance <revoperformance@hotmail.com>

Sent: Saturday, 31 December 2022 11:38 AM

To: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Fw: PRI Request on 27.10.2022 || Ourf: C10018211/JT | | Accident Involving SIG7627R And SKA6793U ON 22/10/2022

Without Prejudice

Dear Sir,
Kindly refer attached as your reference.

Please send us the finalize of vehicle SJIG7627R so that we can submit the LOD.

Thanks & Regards
Joey Chong

Revo Performance Pte Ltd

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 #02-51 & 53 Singapore 417883 (Autobay@KakiBukit)
Tel: (65) 6745 6706

Fax: (65) 6484 3653

www.revoperformance.com.sg

Think Green - Please consider your environmental responsibility before printing this email.

NOTE: This message is from Revo Performance Pte Ltd and may contain confidential business information. It is intended solely for the use of the individual to whom it is addressed. If you are not the intended recipient (or responsible for delivery of the message to such
person), you may not copy or deliver this message to anyone. Kindly notify the sender and please delete this message and any attachment from your system. All opinions, conclusions and other information expressed in this message not of an official nature shall not be
deemed as given or endorsed by Revo Performance Pte Ltd or any of its subsidiaries unless otherwise indicated by an authorised representative independent of this message.

Revo Performance Pte Ltd

Reg No. 201200256H

From: Revo Performance <revoperformance@hotmail.com>

Sent: Friday, October 28, 2022 9:41 AM

To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Cc: jason.tea@budgetdirect.com.sg <jason.tea@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Subject: Re: PRI Request on 27.10.2022 | | Ourf: C10018211/JT || Accident Involving SJIG7627R And SKA6793U ON 22/10/2022

Dear Salizawati,

Okay, noted with thanks.



Regards
Joey Chong

Revo Performance Pte Ltd

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 #02-51 & 53 Singapore 417883 (Autobay@KakiBukit)
Tel: (65) 6745 6706

Fax: (65) 6484 3653

www.revoperformance.com.sg

Think Green - Please consider your environmental responsibility before printing this email.

NOTE: This message is from Revo Performance Pte Ltd and may contain confidential business information. It is intended solely for the use of the individual to whom it is addressed. If you are not the intended recipient (or responsible for delivery of the message to such
person), you may not copy or deliver this message to anyone. Kindly notify the sender and please delete this message and any attachment from your system. All opinions, conclusions and other information expressed in this message not of an official nature shall not be
deemed as given or endorsed by Revo Performance Pte Ltd or any of its subsidiaries unless otherwise indicated by an authorised representative independent of this message.

Revo Performance Pte Ltd

Reg No. 201200256H

From: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, October 28, 2022 8:53 AM

To: Revo Performance <revoperformance@hotmail.com>

Cc: Jason Tea Chee Kiat <jason.tea@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Subject: RE: PRI Request on 27.10.2022 || Ourf: C10018211/JT || Accident Involving SJG7627R And SKA6793U ON 22/10/2022

Dear Joey,

The survey has been arranged.
Our surveyor will contact you the soonest.

Best regards,

Salizawati Haizar
Admin Executive, Claims

F +65 6725 0853
E salizawati.h@budgetdirect.com.sg

It pays to choose | Platinum
_— grust_ed
ervice
Award
Budgﬂt Goleanng ordiance
- Direct | iicix
INsurance | 222 feefo™

From: Revo Performance <revoperformance@hotmail.com>

Sent: Friday, 28 October 2022 10:25 am

To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Subject: Re: PRI Request on 27.10.2022 | | Ourf: C10018211/JT || Accident Involving SJIG7627R And SKA6793U ON 22/10/2022

Dear Sir/Madam,
Good day.

We would like to appoint LKK for our client's SIG7627R.

Thanks & Regards
Joey Chong



Revo Performance Pte Ltd

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 #02-51 & 53 Singapore 417883 (Autobay@KakiBukit)
Tel: (65) 6745 6706

Fax: (65) 6484 3653

www.revoperformance.com.sg

Think Green - Please consider your environmental responsibility before printing this email.

NOTE: This message is from Revo Performance Pte Ltd and may contain confidential business information. It is intended solely for the use of the individual to whom it is addressed. If you are not the intended recipient (or responsible for delivery of the message to such
person), you may not copy or deliver this message to anyone. Kindly notify the sender and please delete this message and any attachment from your system. All opinions, conclusions and other information expressed in this message not of an official nature shall not be
deemed as given or endorsed by Revo Performance Pte Ltd or any of its subsidiaries unless otherwise indicated by an authorised representative independent of this message.

Revo Performance Pte Ltd

Reg No. 201200256H

From: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, October 27, 2022 7:32 AM

To: Revo Performance <revoperformance@hotmail.com>

Cc: Jason Tea Chee Kiat <jason.tea@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Subject: PRI Request on 27.10.2022 | | Ourf: C10018211/JT | | Accident Involving SIG7627R And SKA6793U ON 22/10/2022

Dear Joey,
Please find the list of our proposed surveyors.

1. FTA

2. A-PAC
3. LKK

4. In-house

Kindly let us know within two (2) working days whether you agree to the appointment of any of these motor surveyors.

Best regards,

Salizawati Haizar
Admin Executive, Claims

F +65 6725 0853
E salizawati.h@budgetdirect.com.sg

It pays to choose | Platinum
; Trusted
Service

Budget |Avard

- Direct | iiawx
mnsurance

From: Revo Performance <revoperformance@hotmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, 27 October 2022 10:28 am

To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Subject: Accident Involving SIG7627R And SKA6793U ON 22/10/2022 ALONG PIE TWDS TUAS BEFORE THOMSON EXIT ON LANE 1 ABOUT 1050 HOURS

Dear Officer-In-Charge,
Good day.

Please send a surveyor down our workshop regarding as below.



We are instructed by our client to notify you of a road traffic accident on 22/10/2022 at about 1050 hours,
along PIE TWDS TUAS BEFORE THOMSON EXIT ON LANE 1 involving our client’s SIG7627R and SKA6793U driven by your insured or your insured’s
authorized driver at the material time.

As a result of the accident, our client’s vehicle has been damaged. Before our client / we proceed to repair
the damaged vehicle, please let us know within 2 working days of your receipt of this notice whether you or
your insurer would like to conduct a pre-repair survey of the vehicle. If we do not receive any reply from you
within the stipulated timeline, our client / we shall proceed to repair the vehicle without further reference
to you.

Please be informed that the said vehicle can be inspected at :
Name of workshop : REVO PERFORMANCE PTE LTD

Address : 1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6
#02-51 AutoBay@Kaki Bukit
Singapore 417883

Contact Person : Benjamin Yu 92378224

Thanks & Regards
Joey Chong

Revo Performance Pte Ltd

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 #02-51 & 53 Singapore 417883 (Autobay@KakiBukit)
Tel: (65) 6745 6706

Fax: (65) 6484 3653

www.revoperformance.com.sg

Think Green - Please consider your environmental responsibility before printing this email.

NOTE: This message is from Revo Performance Pte Ltd and may contain confidential business information. It is intended solely for the use of the individual to whom it is addressed. If you are not the intended recipient (or responsible for delivery of the message to such
person), you may not copy or deliver this message to anyone. Kindly notify the sender and please delete this message and any attachment from your system. All opinions, conclusions and other information expressed in this message not of an official nature shall not be
deemed as given or endorsed by Revo Performance Pte Ltd or any of its subsidiaries unless otherwise indicated by an authorised representative independent of this message.

Revo Performance Pte Ltd

Reg No. 201200256H

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by "Reply" command and
permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility
of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or severally, for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use.



