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Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 17 May 2023 10:35 AM

To: SUR; CS A Team

Subject: FW: SFT6666M Final -Estimate Marked

  

From: Xin Yun Auto Main <xinyunauto1@gmail.com> 

Sent: Wednesday, 17 May 2023 10:34:38 am (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore 
To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Re: SFT6666M Final -Estimate Marked 

Dear Taufikh, please proceed to close, thanks.  

 

Best Regards 

Yi Xin 

 

Xin Yun Auto Pte Ltd 

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, #05-23, 

Premier@Kaki Bukit, Singapore 415875 

T: 63340858  | E: xinyunauto1@gmail.com 

 

 

On Wed, May 17, 2023 at 10:20 AM Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Hi Yi Xin, 

  

Please refer attached, COR lumpsum $4850 , 6 days. 

  

Subject to insurance approval. 

  

Regards 

Taufikh 

Lkk Auto 

  

  

From: Xin Yun Auto Main <xinyunauto1@gmail.com>  

Sent: Tuesday, February 7, 2023 7:07 PM 

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Re: SFT6666M Final -Estimate Marked 

  

Dear Taufikh, SFT6666M any pending documents? Please let me know, i will assist asap, thank you. 

  

Best Regards 

Yi Xin 

 

Xin Yun Auto Pte Ltd 

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, #05-23, 

Premier@Kaki Bukit, Singapore 415875 

T: 63340858  | E: xinyunauto1@gmail.com 
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On Mon, Nov 7, 2022 at 9:07 AM Xin Yun Auto Main <xinyunauto1@gmail.com> wrote: 

Dear Taufikh, 

Please refer to attached SFT6666M final pictures for your reference. 

  

Rear sensor and cable we replaced, it may need special coding. I will update you later. 

If needed, i will submit a supplementary attach coding invoice, claim per receipt cost, thanks. 

  

Best Regards 

Yi Xin 

Xin Yun Auto Pte Ltd 

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, #05-23, 

Premier@Kaki Bukit, Singapore 415875 

T: 63340858  | E: xinyunauto1@gmail.com 


