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Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 16 March 2023 10:23 AM

To: SUR; CS A Team

Subject: FW: Finalization for vehicle SLM1392B

  

From: Wendy Khoo <wendy@autobacs.com.sg> 

Sent: Thursday, 16 March 2023 10:22:40 am (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore 
To: Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@lkkauto.com>; Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Re: Finalization for vehicle SLM1392B 

Dear Huey Yon, 

 

We confirm the amount at $5,000.00 with 7 working days. 

 

Thank you. 

 

 

 

Best Regards, 

Wendy 
 

AUTOBACS CAR CARE SINGAPORE PTE LTD 

8 Kaki Bukit Ave 4 #08-40/45/46  

Premier@Kaki Bukit Singapore 415875 

Tel: +65 6702 1555 

Email: wendy@autobacs.com.sg 

 

From: Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@lkkauto.com> 

Sent: Tuesday, March 14, 2023 4:23 PM 

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>; Wendy Khoo <wendy@autobacs.com.sg> 

Subject: RE: Finalization for vehicle SLM1392B  

  

Hi Wendy, 
  

Any updates? 

  

Best Regards, 

Huey Yon | case handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte.Ltd. 
Phone: 6256-3561  Fax: 62564315  email: hueyyon@lkkauto.com 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, Singapore 408933 

  

  

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Thursday, 16 February 2023 4:51 PM 

To: Wendy Khoo <wendy@autobacs.com.sg> 
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Cc: Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: Finalization for vehicle SLM1392B 

  

Hi Wendy, 

  
Please refer attached, COR l/s $5000 , 7 days. 

  

Subject to insurance approval. 

  

Regards 

Taufikh 

Lkk Auto 

  

  

From: Wendy Khoo <wendy@autobacs.com.sg>  

Sent: Monday, 7 November 2022 1:14 pm 

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Admin <admin@autobacs.com.sg> 

Subject: Finalization for vehicle SLM1392B 

  

Dear Taufikh, 

  

Please kindly assist finalize with us for vehicle SLM1392B. 

  

Attached after paint photos and estimate marked for your reference. 

  

Parts       : $5,024.12 after -10% 

S/Nett    : $    100.00 

Labour   : $1,920.00 

L/S Total: $5,635.30 with 07 working days 

  

Hope to hear from you. 

  

Thank you. 

  

  

  

  

Best Regards, 

Wendy 

  

AUTOBACS CAR CARE SINGAPORE PTE LTD 

8 Kaki Bukit Ave 4 #08-40/45/46  

Premier@Kaki Bukit Singapore 415875 

Tel: +65 6702 1555 

Email: wendy@autobacs.com.sg 

 


