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Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Finalization

Sent: Thursday, 12 January 2023 3:48 PM

To: Anikka Lai

Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Subject: SMH95E - FINALIZATION

Attachments: supp.pdf; SMH95E main estimate.pdf; 1061_001.pdf

Hi Anikka, 
 

We will be advising our principal for the costs of repairs in $10,182.03 (P/P, before GST), 12 days. Subject to their approval. 

 
  

 

 

 

 

 

 
Best Regards, 
Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Anikka Lai <anikkalai@honda.com.sg>  

Sent: Wednesday, 11 January 2023 4:22 PM 

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: FW: SMH95E - FINALIZATION 

Importance: High 

  

Dear Shiau Chan, 

  

Understand that GuoQiang has left your company; please assist with the finalization. 

  

Thank you. 
  
Best regards 
Anikka Lai 
Bodyshop Service Advisor 
(Mandai Bodyshop) 
  
Honda Singapore 
Kah Motor Co. Sdn Bhd 
6A Mandai Estate 
Singapore 729903 
DID : 65145248  HP: 82886302 
Web: www.honda.com.sg 
  
  

  

  

From: Anikka Lai  

Sent: Wednesday, 11 January 2023 4:16 PM 

To: GuoQiang@lkkauto.com 

Subject: FW: SMH95E - FINALIZATION 

Importance: High 

  

Dear Guo Qiang, 

  

Attached revised pre-invoice for your kind reference. 

  

The finalise amount should be $10,182.03 as there is a mistake with the discount percentage. 

  

Thank you. 
  
Best regards 
Anikka Lai 
Bodyshop Service Advisor 
(Mandai Bodyshop) 
  
Honda Singapore 
Kah Motor Co. Sdn Bhd 
6A Mandai Estate 
Singapore 729903 
DID : 65145248  HP: 82886302 
Web: www.honda.com.sg 
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From: Anikka Lai  

Sent: Saturday, 17 December 2022 1:01 PM 

To: GuoQiang@lkkauto.com 

Subject: FW: SMH95E - FINALIZATION 

Importance: High 

  

REMINDER! 

  

From: Anikka Lai  

Sent: Friday, 25 November 2022 4:01 PM 

To: GuoQiang@lkkauto.com 

Subject: SMH95E - FINALIZATION 

  

Dear Guo Qiang, 

We enclosed the total final repair costs for, 

Vehicle No.    SMH95E 

Final Repair Costs (exclude GST)   $ 10,189.61 

Repair Period* (Days)   12 days 

*Note: Repair period does include Sunday and Public Holiday.es include Sunday and Public Holiday.ir period does include Sunday and Public Holiday. 

Please examine the above information carefully. If no discrepancy is reported within 7 days (exclude Sunday and Public Holiday) from the date of this email, the 

information will be considered as correct. Thereafter, no adjustment will be made. 

  

In addition, I have attached photos of before paint, ‘?’ items and supplementary parts (if any) for your records. 

  

  

Thank you. 

  

Best regards 
Anikka LaiAnikka LaiAnikka LaiAnikka Lai 

Bodyshop Service Advisor 

(Mandai Bodyshop) 
  

Honda Singapore 

Kah Motor Co. Sdn Bhd 

6A Mandai Estate 

Singapore 729903 

DID : 65145248  HP: 82886302 

Web: www.honda.com.sg 

  

  

  

From: Printer Service <printservice@honda.com.sg>  

Sent: Friday, 25 November 2022 3:40 PM 

To: Anikka Lai <anikkalai@honda.com.sg> 

Subject: Attached Image 

  

  

 
Confidential Note: The information contained in this email is intended only for the use of the individual or entity named above and may contain 

information that is privileged, confidential and exempt from disclosure under applicable law. If the reader of this message is not the intended 

recipient, you are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this communication is strictly prohibited. If you have received this 

message in error, please immediately notify the sender and delete the mail. Thank you. 


