Celine Fong (LKKAuto)

From: Chee Kiong <cheekiong@seahong.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 26 October 2022 6:28 PM

To: '‘Corene Chong'; Admin A

Cc: assignments; SUR; 'Heng Xin Yi'; 'Kuldip Singh’; ‘Michael Yap'

Subject: RE: SJE APPPOINTMENT | Crossborders LLC ref: AJ.tk.7459.2020.XY - PDI;| Seah Ong
Ref: 21.29311 ERGO | PF VEHICLE: SMP6696P | DF VEHICLE: GBD626A | DOA: 14
September 2020

Attachments: Assessment Report-21.29311 ERGO.pdf; Ol GIA RPT.pdf; Survey Photos -
SMP6696P.pdf

Dear Adrian

The survey photos and report from Insurlogic is enclosed herewith together with our client’s insured’s GIA report.
Thanks !

Yours
Tan Chee Kiong
Seah Ong & Partners LLP

From: Corene Chong <corene@crossborderslic.com>

Sent: Wednesday, October 26, 2022 4:53 PM

To: admin-a@lkkauto.com

Cc: assignments@Ikkauto.com; sur@lkkauto.com; Chee Kiong <cheekiong@seahong.com.sg>; Heng Xin Yi
<xinyi@seahong.com.sg>; Kuldip Singh <kuldip@crossborderslic.com>; Michael Yap <michael@crossborderslic.com>
Subject: SJE APPPOINTMENT | Crossborders LLC ref: AJ.tk.7459.2020.XY - PDI;| Seah Ong Ref: 21.29311 ERGO | PF
VEHICLE: SMP6696P | DF VEHICLE: GBD626A | DOA: 14 September 2020

Your attention is drawn to the CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE below.

MC NO. 8031 OF 2021
ATTENTION: MR LING WAI PING, ADRIAN

Dear Sirs

1. We refer to the above matter.

2. We act for the Plaintiff (owner of SMP6696P) and Seah Ong & Partners LLP (copied
herein) act for the 15tand 2" Defendant (Driver and Owner of GBD626A).

3. Please be informed that the Court had appointed you, MR LING WAI PING, ADRIAN,
as the Single Joint Expert (“SJE”) for this matter.

4, The following documents is attached as follows:-



a.

a. Singapore Accident Statement of SMP6696P dated 14 September 2020 (with
coloured photographs);

b.  Singapore Accident Statement of GBD626A dated 14 September 2020 (with
coloured photographs);

c. PARF/COE Rebate as of 15 September 2020;

e. Pro-Option Services’ Report and coloured photographs; and

f.  Repair Bill from Xin Yun Auto Private Limited.

Background information:

The collision occurred on 14 September 2020 at about 08:45 hours along 6

Serangoon North between both the Plaintiff's and the 2" Defendant's vehicles. Both
parties’ GIA Reports described how the accident took place.

b.

The Plaintiff appointed Pro-Option Services to conduct PRS of the Plaintiff's vehicle,
and estimated lump sum repairs of $46,854.22 and 31 (Thirty One) working days for repair

period.

6.

Please liaise with us (M/s Crossborders LLC ) for a physical re-inspection (if
required) of SMP6696P and thereafter prepare an SJE report to record your findings.

render your report by 4 November 2022 pursuant to the Court’s directions.

7.

8.

9.

The Defendant solicitors’ reference number is 21.29311 ERGO.

Kindly issue your tax invoice equally to both parties.

Kindly acknowledge receipt of the assignment and let us know if you require a physical

re-inspection.

10. Thank you.

Thank You.

Regards
Corene

TEL: 6438 1323 (ext 2004)

Please



CrossBorders LLC

133 New Bridge Road
#23-03/04/05 Chinatown Point
Singapore 059413

Tel: (65) 6438 1323

Fax: (65) 6438 2313

* IMPORTANT - CROSSBORDERS LLC COVID 19 ADVISORY *

Please be informed that masks are encouraged to be on at all times during appointments.

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE

This e-mail from CrossBorders LLC (including any attachment(s) to it) is confidential and may also be privileged and exempt from disclosure under
applicable law. Accordingly, if you are not the intended recipient please notify us immediately, delete this e-mail (including any attachment to it)
from your computer system and do not disclose or distribute it to any other person or continue to read this e-mail. Thank you.

CrossBorders LLC DOES NOT ACCEPT SERVICE OF COURT DOCUMENTS OR NOTICE OF ANY PROCEEDINGS BY FACSIMILE OR EMAIL



