Meng Yan (LKK Auto)

From: Meng Yan (LKK Auto)

Sent: Thursday, 27 October 2022 11:23 AM

To: Koh, Janice (Allianz Insurance Singapore); SUR; assignments

Subject: RE: AIS REF: 2022 22007625/JK - (OD claim Insured: GBL 48947) - DOA: 21.10.2022

Dear Janice,

Noted with thanks.

Best Regards,
Yan | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Koh, Janice (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <janice.koh@allianz.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 27 October 2022 11:17 AM

To: Meng Yan (LKK Auto) <mengyan@Ilkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; assignments
<assignments@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: AIS REF: 2022 22007625/JK - (OD claim Insured: GBL 4894Z) - DOA: 21.10.2022

Internal

HiYan,
Please conduct desktop survey.
Unless there is a need for surveyor to conduct physical survey, then you will have to write in to request for it.

Thank you

Janice Koh
Claims Specialist
Claims & Performance Management

Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. | UEN 201903913C
79 Robinson Road #09-01, Singapore 068897

www.allianz.sg

QQO | Altianz @) | (.~

Warldwide Olympic ond Perolymplc Portner

Please note: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential and / or privileged
information. If you are not the intended recipient, please do not read, copy, use or disclose the contents of this communication to others and notify
the sender immediately. Then please delete the e-mail and any copies of it. Thank you.

& Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail.

From: Meng Yan (LKK Auto) <mengyan@lkkauto.com>
Sent: 27 October, 2022 11:12 AM




To: Koh, Janice (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <janice.koh@allianz.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; assignments
<assignments@lkkauto.com>
Subject: [EXT] RE: AIS REF: 2022 22007625/JK - (OD claim Insured: GBL 4894Z) - DOA: 21.10.2022

Internal

Dear Janice,
May I clarify with you, this OD case conduct desktop survey or physical survey?

Kindly advise. Thank you.

Best Regards,
Yan | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Meng Yan (LKK Auto) <mengyan@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 27 October 2022 11:03 AM

To: Koh, Janice (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <janice.koh@allianz.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>;
assignments <assignments(@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: AIS REF: 2022 22007625/JK - (OD claim Insured: GBL 48947) - DOA: 21.10.2022

Dear Janice,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed that vehicle not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

Best Regards,
Yan | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Koh, Janice (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <janice.koh@allianz.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 26 October 2022 5:42 PM

To: chong pohkin <pohkin@kgcworkshop.com.sg>

Cec: admin-d <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Subject: AIS REF: 2022 22007625/JK - (OD claim Insured: GBL 4894Z) - DOA: 21.10.2022

Internal

Dear Sir,

Please be informed we had appointed LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd to conduct survey.



Please liaise with them directly.

Thank you

Janice Koh
Claims Specialist
Claims & Performance Management

Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. | UEN 201903913C
79 Robinson Road #09-01, Singapore 068897

www.allianz.sg

QQD | Anianz @ | (.o
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Please note: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential and / or privileged
information. If you are not the intended recipient, please do not read, copy, use or disclose the contents of this communication to others and notify
the sender immediately. Then please delete the e-mail and any copies of it. Thank you.

&4 Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail.

From: chong pohkin <pohkin@kgcworkshop.com.sg>

Sent: 26 October, 2022 12:02 PM

To: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>

Subject: [EXT] NEW OD Claim; Policy Nos. SPMC1000000818 (OD claim Insured: GBL 48947)
Importance: High

Ref: Policy Nos. SPMC1000000818 (OD claim Insured: GBL 48942)
Dear Sir,
We refer to the above matter.

We are appointed repairer for TSL ELECTRICAL SERVICES, whose vehicle was owner of registration number
GBL 4894 was damaged in the above accident.

Date of Loss: 21/10/2022

Workshop Name: KGC Workshop Pte Ltd (AMK)

Workshop Address: 14 Ang Mo Kio Street 63, Block B, Singapore 569116.
Workshop Contact No.: 8189 2986

Claimant Vehicle No.: GBL 48947

Insured Vehicle No.: GBL 48947

Kindly review and revert approval.
Thank You.

Regards,
Poh Kin, Chong

Claims Executive

KGC WORKSHOP PTE LTD

14 Ang Mo Kio St 63, Block B (Singapore 569116)

Tel (65) 6451 0353 / 6453 6279 | F (65) 6456 5410 | M (65) 8189 2986
E pohkin@kgcworkshop.com.sg

n Like our Facebook page today!

www.facebook.com/kgcworkshop




