Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

Sent: Thursday, 24 November 2022 2:49 PM

To: Ng Mei Yen

Cc: Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

Subject: FINALIZE - SLU432)

Attachments: SLU 432 Final and Supp.pdf; SLU 432 main estimate.pdf
Hi Mei Yen,

Finalize confirm. Please proceed.

Thanks.

Best Regards,
Steve Chen| Automotive Assessor
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 81117723/6256-3561 | email: stevenfoong@Ilkkauto.com| fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Ng Mei Yen <MeiYen.Ng@inchcape.com.sg>
Sent: Thursday, 24 November 2022 2:26 pm

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: FW: FINALIZE - SLU432)

From: Ng Mei Yen

Sent: Thursday, 24 November 2022 2:24 pm

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <stevechen@lkkauto.com>
Subject: FW: FINALIZE - SLU432)

From: Ng Mei Yen

Sent: Thursday, 24 November 2022 1:23 pm

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <stevechen@lkkauto.com>
Subject: FW: FINALIZE - SLU432)



From: Ng Mei Yen

Sent: Tuesday, 8 November 2022 6:22 pm

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <stevechen@lkkauto.com>
Subject: FINALIZE - SLU432)J

Hi Steve
Attach finalize report & before repair photos. 7 days

Thank you
MeiYen



