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FW: TP DS claim: Third Party Claim FBN9819Z

Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>
Wed 26/10/2022 3:45 PM

To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

2 attachments (2 MB)

SMX4429R-OI.pdf; FBN9819Z(TP).pdf;

 
 
Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

 
From: Meng Yan (LKK Auto) <mengyan@lkkauto.com> 

Sent: Tuesday, 25 October 2022 3:28 PM

To: admin-d <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Subject: FW: TP DS claim: Third Party Claim FBN9819Z
 
 
 
 
 

Best Regards,

Yan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com  | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
 

From: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg> 

Sent: Tuesday, 25 October 2022 2:28 PM

To: Meng Yan (LKK Auto) <mengyan@lkkauto.com>

Subject: FW: TP DS claim: Third Party Claim FBN9819Z
 

Internal

 
Dear Yan
 
As per enclosed
 
Thanks
 
Shanti
 

mailto:denisetay@lkkauto.com
mailto:assignments@lkkauto.com
mailto:claims@allianz.com.sg
mailto:mengyan@lkkauto.com
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From: Meng Yan (LKK Auto) <mengyan@lkkauto.com> 

Sent: Tuesday, October 25, 2022 1:22 PM

To: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>;
admin-d <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Subject: [EXT] RE: TP DS claim: Third Party Claim FBN9819Z
 

Internal

 
Dear Shanti,
 
Kindly re-send the link to us.
 

Best Regards,

Yan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com  | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
 
From: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg> 

Sent: Saturday, 22 October 2022 11:12 AM

To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; admin-d <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Subject: FW: TP DS claim: Third Party Claim FBN9819Z
 

Internal

 
PW: Allianz1
 

From: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) 

Sent: Saturday, October 22, 2022 11:10 AM

To: Yan (LKK Auto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>; admin-a@lkkauto.com

Cc: Southern Motor <soumotorclaims@hotmail.com>

Subject: TP DS claim: Third Party Claim FBN9819Z
 

 

Your ref: FBN9819Z

Our ref: 2022 22007294KC-SMX4429R

 

 

Dear Sirs,

 

We hereby appoint our direct settlement partners  LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd  to conduct survey.
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Kindly engage with them to arrange for survey.

 

Please download the documents from this link below (For Survey)

 

File: FBN9819Z(TP).pdf, SMX4429R-OI.pdf

Link: https://filexchange.allianz.de/SecureDownload.aspx?id=bb6c2a42-0611-4919-9af8-5660d4c09f02-
80ffcb852cfe6fcc

Size: ~ 2 MByte, Download available until: 11/5/2022

 

Passwords will be sent in a separate email.

 

 

Thank you.

 

Best regards,

 

 

   Shanti. R

   Claims Service

   Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. | UEN 201903913C

   79 Robinson Road #09-01 I Singapore 068897

   Phone: +65 6395 3836 | www.allianz.sg

 

  

 

 

https://filexchange.allianz.de/SecureDownload.aspx?id=bb6c2a42-0611-4919-9af8-5660d4c09f02-80ffcb852cfe6fcc
http://www.allianz.sg/
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    This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain
confidential and / 

    or privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient, please do not read, copy, use or disclose the
contents of

    this communication to others and notify the sender immediately. Then please delete the e-mail and any copies
of it.  

    Thank you.

 

 P Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail.

 
 
From: Southern Motor <soumotorclaims@hotmail.com> 

Sent: Friday, October 21, 2022 10:53 AM

To: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>

Subject: [EXT] Third Party Claim FBN9819Z
 
 
Hi ,
 
Kindly arrange survey for the motorcycle FBN9819Z .
 
Survey Type                                 : New survey
 

 
Vehicle to be surveyed             :   FBN9819Z

 
Your Insured Vehicle                : SMX4429R

 
Date of Accident                     :  07.10.2022

 
 

Name of Workshop               : SOUTHERN MOTOR
 

Address of Survey Location : BLK 1006 ,BUKIT MERAH LANE 2
                                                    #01-10 ,  SE 159762

 
Name of Contact Person       : AH HUAT

 
 

 
 
Thanks,
 
Ti Ti
Southern Motor
6273-0369

mailto:soumotorclaims@hotmail.com
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