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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Sent: Monday, 22 May 2023 10:44 AM
To: Desmond Toh
Cc: Admin A
Subject: RE: SJG523C - TP CLAIM AGAINST SMK9555U DOA: 21.10.2022 *** LKK REF: 

CC4/AIS22010542/Epa3

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’ 
  SAVE AS TO COSTS 
 
Dear Sirs 
 
Solely for purposes of amicable settlement, we are agreeable to resolve the matter at S$11,371.43 (all in) in full 
and final settlement of all claims your client has or may have against Allianz Insurance Singapore and/or their 
insured arising out of this incident.  
 
If the above offer is accepted, kindly confirm settlement by providing a copy of the Letter of Authorization / 
Warrant to Act  and your Bank details for us to process payment.   
 
Please note that your client’s receipt of the settlement sum or settlement sums shall constitute a full discharge of 
liability and waiver of any past, present or future claims your client may have against Allianz Insurance Singapore 
and/or our insured as a result of the accident on 21 OCT 2022.  
 
Please note that the clearance of this cheque / settlement sum or receipt of the successful electronic payment or 
payments constitutes your client’s acceptance of payment and full discharge of liability. 
 
Thank you.  
 
 

 
Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

 
 

From: Desmond Toh <desmondtoh@honda.com.sg>  
Sent: Thursday, May 18, 2023 9:20 AM 
To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: SJG523C - TP CLAIM AGAINST SMK9555U DOA: 21.10.2022 *** LKK REF: CC4/AIS22010542/Epa3  
 
Dear All, 
 
Kindly let us have the above 
offer.                                                                                                                                                                                                       
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Best Regards, 
Desmond Toh  
Bodyshop Supervisor 
Mandai Body Repair & Paint 
 
Honda Singapore 
Kah Motor Co. Sdn. Bhd. 
8 Mandai Estate  
Singapore 729905 
DID:: 6514 5848  
Web: www.honda.com.sg 
 

           
 

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Sunday, April 23, 2023 7:19 PM 
To: Desmond Toh <desmondtoh@honda.com.sg>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: SJG523C - TP CLAIM AGAINST SMK9555U DOA: 21.10.2022 *** LKK REF: CC4/AIS22010542/Epa3  
 
CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize 
the sender and know the content is safe. 

 
Dear Sir / Madam, 
  
Thank you for your email. 
  
Our respective case handler will look into the matter and get back to you in due course. 
  
Hi HT, 
  
Kindly assist. 
  
To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned. 
  

Thank you. 
Best Regards, 
Mei Kwan | Admin 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

From: Desmond Toh <desmondtoh@honda.com.sg>  
Sent: Friday, April 21, 2023 5:08 PM 
To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: FW: SJG523C - TP CLAIM AGAINST SMK9555U DOA: 21.10.2022 
 
Your Ref: SMK9555U 
  
Our Ref: SJG523C 
  
    
M/s: Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd.  
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C/o: LKK Auto Consultants 
  

   
79 Robinson #09-01 

  
   

Singapore 068897 
  

  
Attn: Claims Handler  

 

          
        
Dear All, 
  
Above is the attached document for third party direct settlement claim. 
  
Kindly provide us your finalized settlement & payment as your soonest. 
  
Will appreciate your response after receiving this email. 
 
 
Best Regards, 
Desmond Toh  
Bodyshop Supervisor 
Mandai Body Repair & Paint 
 
Honda Singapore 
Kah Motor Co. Sdn. Bhd. 
8 Mandai Estate  
Singapore 729905 
DID:: 6514 5848  
Web: www.honda.com.sg 
 

           
 

From: Printer Service <printservice@honda.com.sg>  
Sent: Friday, April 21, 2023 2:00 PM 
To: Desmond Toh <desmondtoh@honda.com.sg> 
Subject: Attached Image 
 
 

 

Confidential Note: The information contained in this email is intended only for the use of the 
individual or entity named above and may contain information that is privileged, confidential and 
exempt from disclosure under applicable law. If the reader of this message is not the intended 
recipient, you are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this 
communication is strictly prohibited. If you have received this message in error, please immediately 
notify the sender and delete the mail. Thank you. 
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