Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 8 March 2023 12:26 PM

To: 'ENG HUEY NI'

Cc: Admin A; ‘MT_Claim_SG'

Subject: RE: Check liability - Accident involving SJR8089D(OI) & SDM1052C on 30.08.2022

// Lonpac Ref: 22/22/22/VP05/026262

Dear Huey Ni,
As spoken, we will proceed to submit WP report to your good office soon.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, December 27, 2022 12:40 PM

To: ENG HUEY NI <hneng@Ilonpac.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>

Subject: RE: Check liability - Accident involving SJR8089D(OI) & SDM1052C on 30.08.2022 // Lonpac Ref:
22/22/22/VP05/026262

Dear Sirs/ Mdm,

Enclosed for your perusal is: -
e Estimated cost of repair.
e Preliminary advice.

e Photographs of TP vehicle in its damaged condition

Thank you.



Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
S5(408933)

From: ENG HUEY NI <hneng@lonpac.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 25 October 2022 1:54 PM

To: admin-d <admin-d@Ikkauto.com>; SUR <sur@Ilkkauto.com>

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>

Subject: FW: Check liability - Accident involving SIR8089D(0Ol) & SDM1052C on 30.08.2022 // Lonpac Ref:
22/22/22/VP05/026262

Lonpac External - Confidential

HiYan,
We attach the GIA reports of Ol and TP for your perusal.
Thanks

Huey Ni

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt
practices.

From: ENG HUEY NI <hneng@lonpac.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 25 October 2022 1:52 pm

To: wei.shong@tImotor.com.sg

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; 'Sharon Ten' <sharon.ten@tlmotor.com.sg>; Admin-D (LKKAuto)
<admin-d@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Check liability - Accident involving SJR8089D(OI) & SDM1052C on 30.08.2022 // Lonpac Ref:
22/22/22/VP05/026262

Lonpac External - General
WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Hi Wei Shong,

Thank you for your reply.

Hi Yan,

Please liase with Wei Shong of Tan Lim Motor to arrange for the survey. Thanks.



Thank you.
Best Regards

Eng Huey Ni

Asst. Claims Manager | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
DID: 6279 9244 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

The all CHew" lonpac.com.sg

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt
practices.

From: wei.shong@tlmotor.com.sg <wei.shong@tlmotor.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 25 October 2022 1:25 pm

To: ENG HUEY NI <hneng@lonpac.com>

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; 'Sharon Ten' <sharon.ten@tlmotor.com.sg>

Subject: RE: Check liability - Accident involving SJR8089D(OI) & SDM1052C on 30.08.2022 // Lonpac Ref:
22/22/22/VP05/026262

Without Prejudice

Dear Huey Ni,

We select Marcus Chua — LKK to conduct PRI.
Thank you.

Regards,

TANLM Tan Lim Motor Pte Lt

La_m_ Wei Shong O. +656858 5151 1 Defu Lane 6
William F. +656858 0877 Singapore 539365
wei.shong@tlmotor.com.sg http://www.timotor.com.sg

Confidentiality Notice: This email (including any attachments) is intended for the recipient(s) named above and may contain information that is confidential to Tan Lim |
Pte Ltd. Any use of the information (including,but not limited to, total or partial reproduction, distribution or dissemination in any form) by persons other than the intended
recipient(s) is prohibited. If you are not an intended recipient of this email, please notify the sender immediately and delete it. While Tan Lim Motor has put in place anti-v
programs, we do not accept responsibility for any damage caused by viruses passed on unwittingly.

From: ENG HUEY NI <hneng@lonpac.com>

Sent: Tuesday, October 25, 2022 11:54 AM

To: wei.shong@tImotor.com.sg

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; 'Sharon Ten' <sharon.ten@tlmotor.com.sg>

Subject: RE: Check liability - Accident involving SJR8089D(OI) & SDM1052C on 30.08.2022 // Lonpac Ref:
22/22/22/VP05/026262




Lonpac External - General
WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Hi Wei Shong,

Thank you for your email.

Here is our list of surveyors. Please select one from below:

Jackson Quek —Appraisal
Nicholas Tey -Appraisal
Bryan Tammi Ang - LKK
Qing Guo Qiong- LKK
Marcus Chua - LKK
Kenneth Kong- LKK
Mohd Nazril- LKK

Mohd Taufik - LKK
Adrian Ling—LKK

Mohd Rasul - LKK

V(o (N|o|n|A|WIN |-

=
o

Thank you.

Huey Ni

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt
practices.

From: wei.shong@tImotor.com.sg <wei.shong@tlmotor.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 25 October 2022 11:49 am

To: ENG HUEY NI <hneng@I|onpac.com>

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; 'Sharon Ten' <sharon.ten@tlmotor.com.sg>

Subject: RE: Check liability - Accident involving SJR8089D(OI) & SDM1052C on 30.08.2022 // Lonpac Ref:
22/22/22/VP05/026262

Without Prejudice

Dear Huey Ni,

Can we select LKK Auto to survey our client vehicle?
Thank you.

Regards,



TANLIM

Tan Lim Motor Pte Ltc

Lam Wei Shong 0. +65 6858 5151 1 Defu Lane 6
William F. +656858 0877 Singapore 539365
wei.shong@tlmotor.com.sg http://www.timotor.com.sg

Confidentiality Notice: This email (including any attachments) is intended for the recipient(s) named above and may contain information that is confidential to Tan Lim |
Pte Ltd. Any use of the information (including,but not limited to, total or partial reproduction, distribution or dissemination in any form) by persons other than the intended
recipient(s) is prohibited. If you are not an intended recipient of this email, please notify the sender immediately and delete it. While Tan Lim Motor has put in place anti-v
programs, we do not accept responsibility for any damage caused by viruses passed on unwittingly.

From: ENG HUEY NI <hneng@I|onpac.com>

Sent: Tuesday, October 25, 2022 11:19 AM

To: wei.shong@tImotor.com.sg

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Sharon Ten <sharon.ten@tlmotor.com.sg>

Subject: Check liability - Accident involving SJR8089D(0I) & SDM1052C on 30.08.2022 // Lonpac Ref:
22/22/22/VP05/026262

Lonpac External - General

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Hi Wei Shong,
Thank you for your email.

Strictly on a without prejudice basis and in view of conflicting versions, we will offer
to settle your client’s claim at 50% liability based on our surveyor’s recommendation.

Please arrange for survey if it has not been done.

Best Regards

Eng Huey Ni

Asst. Claims Manager | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
DID: 6279 9244 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

The all THeW" |onpac.com.sg

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt
practices.

From: wei.shong@tIlmotor.com.sg <wei.shong@tlmotor.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 29 September 2022 10:23 am

To: ENG HUEY NI <hneng@Ilonpac.com>; KENNY LIM CHING GHEE <kennylim@lonpac.com>; MT_Claim_SG
<mt_claim@lonpac.com>

Cc: frontdesk@tlmotor.com.sg; sharon.ten@tlmotor.com.sg

5




Subject: RE: Check Liability - Accident involving SDM1052C and SJR8089D (NTUC) on 30.08.2022 // Lonpac Ref:
22/22/22/VP05/026262

Without Prejudice
Dear Huey Ni,
Any update?
Thank you.

Regards,

TANLM Tan Lim Motor Pte Lt

La_rr! Wei Shong O. +656858 5151 1 Defu Lane 6
William F. +656858 0877 Singapore 539365
wei.shong@tlmotor.com.sg http://www.timotor.com.sg

Confidentiality Notice: This email (including any attachments) is intended for the recipient(s) named above and may contain information that is confidential to Tan Lim |
Pte Ltd. Any use of the information (including,but not limited to, total or partial reproduction, distribution or dissemination in any form) by persons other than the intended
recipient(s) is prohibited. If you are not an intended recipient of this email, please notify the sender immediately and delete it. While Tan Lim Motor has put in place anti-v
programs, we do not accept responsibility for any damage caused by viruses passed on unwittingly.

From: wei.shong@tlmotor.com.sg <wei.shong@tlmotor.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, September 16, 2022 9:39 AM

To: 'ENG HUEY NI' <hneng@lonpac.com>; 'KENNY LIM CHING GHEE' <kennylim@lonpac.com>; ‘MT_Claim_SG'
<mt_claim@Ilonpac.com>

Cc: 'frontdesk@tlmotor.com.sg' <frontdesk@tlmotor.com.sg>; 'sharon.ten@tlmotor.com.sg'
<sharon.ten@tlmotor.com.sg>

Subject: RE: Check Liability - Accident involving SDM1052C and SJR8089D (NTUC) on 30.08.2022 // Lonpac Ref:
22/22/22/VP05/026262

Without Prejudice

Dear Huey Ni,

Thank you for your reply.

Any evidence for your insured? If not please settle this case at 50% based on BOLA.
Thank you.

Regards,

TANLM Tan Lim Motor Pte Lt

La_rr! Wei Shong O. +656858 5151 1 Defu Lane 6
William F. +656858 0877 Singapore 539365
wei.shong@tlmotor.com.sg http://www.timotor.com.sg

Confidentiality Notice: This email (including any attachments) is intended for the recipient(s) named above and may contain information that is confidential to Tan Lim |
Pte Ltd. Any use of the information (including,but not limited to, total or partial reproduction, distribution or dissemination in any form) by persons other than the intended
recipient(s) is prohibited. If you are not an intended recipient of this email, please notify the sender immediately and delete it. While Tan Lim Motor has put in place anti-v
programs, we do not accept responsibility for any damage caused by viruses passed on unwittingly.



From: ENG HUEY NI <hneng@lonpac.com>

Sent: Wednesday, September 14, 2022 6:32 PM

To: wei.shong@tlmotor.com.sg; KENNY LIM CHING GHEE <kennylim@lonpac.com>; MT_Claim_SG
<mt_claim@Ilonpac.com>

Cc: frontdesk@tImotor.com.sg; sharon.ten@tlmotor.com.sg

Subject: RE: Check Liability - Accident involving SDM1052C and SJR8089D (NTUC) on 30.08.2022 // Lonpac Ref:
22/22/22/VP05/026262

Lonpac External - General

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Hi Wei Shong,

Liability is in dispute. Our insured reported your client’s vehicle overtook her vehicle.

Thank you.

Best Regards

Eng Huey Ni

Asst. Claims Manager | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
DID: 6279 9244 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

The all CNeW? |[onpac.com.sg

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt
practices.

From: wei.shong@tImotor.com.sg <wei.shong@tlmotor.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 13 September 2022 5:14 pm

To: KENNY LIM CHING GHEE <kennylim@Ilonpac.com>; MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@Ilonpac.com>
Cc: frontdesk@tImotor.com.sg; sharon.ten@tlmotor.com.sg

Subject: RE: Check Liability - Accident involving SDM1052C and SJR8089D (NTUC) on 30.08.2022

Without Prejudice
Dear Kenny,

Any update?
Thank you.

Regards,



TANLIM

Tan Lim Motor Pte Ltc

Lam Wei Shong 0. +65 6858 5151 1 Defu Lane 6
William F. +656858 0877 Singapore 539365
wei.shong@tlmotor.com.sg http://www.timotor.com.sg

Confidentiality Notice: This email (including any attachments) is intended for the recipient(s) named above and may contain information that is confidential to Tan Lim |
Pte Ltd. Any use of the information (including,but not limited to, total or partial reproduction, distribution or dissemination in any form) by persons other than the intended
recipient(s) is prohibited. If you are not an intended recipient of this email, please notify the sender immediately and delete it. While Tan Lim Motor has put in place anti-v
programs, we do not accept responsibility for any damage caused by viruses passed on unwittingly.

From: KENNY LIM CHING GHEE <kennylim@lonpac.com>

Sent: Tuesday, September 6, 2022 3:47 PM

To: wei.shong@tImotor.com.sg; MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>

Cc: frontdesk@tImotor.com.sg; sharon.ten@tlmotor.com.sg

Subject: RE: Check Liability - Accident involving SDM1052C and SJR8089D (NTUC) on 30.08.2022

Lonpac External - Confidential

Without Prejudice
Dear Wei Shong

We are unable to confirm liability at this juncture as our Insured has yet to report the
accident to us.

Please bear with us for the time being while we check.
Thank you.

Best Regards

Kenny Lim

Asst. Claims Manager | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/06 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
DID: 6279 9256 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

The all CNeW? |[onpac.com.sg

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt
practices.

From: wei.shong@tImotor.com.sg <wei.shong@tlmotor.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 6 September 2022 3:29 pm

To: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@Ilonpac.com>; KENNY LIM CHING GHEE <kennylim@I|onpac.com>
Cc: frontdesk@tImotor.com.sg; sharon.ten@tlmotor.com.sg

Subject: RE: Check Liability - Accident involving SDM1052C and SJR8089D (NTUC) on 30.08.2022

Without Prejudice



Dear Kenny,
We still waiting for your reply, please advise liability as soon as possible.
Thank you.

Regards,

Tan Lim Motor Pte Ltc

La_rr! Wei Shong O. +656858 5151 1 Defu Lane 6
William F. +656858 0877 Singapore 539365
wei.shong@tlmotor.com.sg http://www.timotor.com.sg

Confidentiality Notice: This email (including any attachments) is intended for the recipient(s) named above and may contain information that is confidential to Tan Lim |
Pte Ltd. Any use of the information (including,but not limited to, total or partial reproduction, distribution or dissemination in any form) by persons other than the intended
recipient(s) is prohibited. If you are not an intended recipient of this email, please notify the sender immediately and delete it. While Tan Lim Motor has put in place anti-v
programs, we do not accept responsibility for any damage caused by viruses passed on unwittingly.

Q Virus-free.www.avast.com



