Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 31 March 2023 9:28 AM
To: SUR; CS A Team

Subject: FW: SNG1340J - Finalize

From: MY CAR CONSULTANT <admin@mycar.sg>

Sent: Friday, 31 March 2023 9:27:40 am (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore
To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SNG1340] - Finalize

Hi,
Please proceed to close.

Regards
Daud

From: "Taufikh (LKKAuto)" <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>
Sent: 3/30/23 5:48 PM

To: "admin@mycar.sg" <admin@mycar.sg>

Cec: "Veron Chen (LKKAuto)" <veronchen@Ilkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: SNG1340J - Finalize

Hi Jackson,

Refer attached, COR 1/s $3000 , 3 days.

Subject to insurance approval

Regards
Taufikh

Lkk Auto

From: MY CAR CONSULTANT <admin@mycar.sg>

Sent: Thursday, March 16, 2023 3:50 PM

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>

Cec: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>
Subject: SNG1340J - Finalize

Hi Taufikh,



Kindly finalize the above vehicle.

Thanks

Best Regards,

Jackson Ho

Claim Handler | Motor Claims Department
My Car Consultant Pte Ltd

M: 8344 7681 | F: 6925 5219
W: Mycar.sg | E: admin@mycar.sg

60 Jalan Lam Huat, Carros Centre #05-21 S(737869)
UEN No.: 201605878Z



