Meng Yan (LKK Auto)

From: Meng Yan (LKK Auto)

Sent: Tuesday, 25 October 2022 4:53 PM

To: Claims; admin-d; SUR; assignments

Cc: Justin Wong; Derrick Quok; Kenneth Lim

Subject: RE: TPPD survey: Claim ref: C10018205/KY || OI- SMP3150S (White) TP- SLB3781G || Est:

$0.00 || JWG INTERNATIONAL PTE LTD

Dear Sir/Madam,
Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards,
Yan | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 25 October 2022 4:41 PM

To: admin-d <admin-d@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@Ilkkauto.com>; assignments <assignments@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Justin Wong <justin.wong@budgetdirect.com.sg>; Derrick Quok <derrick.g@budgetdirect.com.sg>; Kenneth Lim
<kenneth.lim@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Subject: TPPD survey: Claim ref: C10018205/KY | | OI- SMP3150S (White) TP- SLB3781G | | Est: $0.00 | | JWG
INTERNATIONAL PTE LTD

Hi Team

We wish to appoint LKK to conduct survey for the TP vehicle number: SLB3781G
JWG INTERNATIONAL PTE LTD

10 Ang Mo Kio Ind Park 2A, #03-08

AMK Autopoint, Singapore 568047

Contact: 6909 8882

Please find attached GIA reports for your reference.

TP yet to make the reporting.

Best regards,

Salizawati Haizar
Admin Executive, Claims

F +65 6725 0853
E salizawati.h@budgetdirect.com.sg
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From: JWG CLAIMS <jwg.claims@yahoo.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 25 October 2022 1:32 pm

To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Cc: Justin Wong <justin.wong@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Subject: Re: PRI Request on 25.10.2022 | | Ourf: C10018205/KY || PRI ARRANGEMENT SLB3781G | ACC ON 21/10/2022
INV VEH NO SLB3781G & SMP3150S

Without Prejudice,

Dear Sir / Madam,
We would like to appoint LKK to conduct the PRS

Thank you

Warmest Regards,
JWG INTERNATIONAL PTE. LTD.

10, Ang Mo Kio Ind Park 2A
#03-08 AMK AutoPoint
Singapore 568047

Tel: 6909 8882 | Fax: 6909 9592
E-mail: jwg.claims@yahoo.com

From: JWG CLAIMS <jwg.claims@yahoo.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 25 October 2022 10:44 am

To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Subject: PRI ARRANGEMENT SLB3781G | ACC ON 21/10/2022 ALONG PIE (CHANGI) BEFORE EUNOS EXIT INV
VEH NO. SLB3781G (OUR REF) & SMP3150S (YOUR REF)

Without Prejudice,

RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLB3781G ALONG PIE (CHANGI) BEFORE EUNOS
EXIT ON 21/10/2022 @ 1720HRS.

We refer to the above matter.



We are instructed to notify you of a road accident on 21-Oct-2022 at about 1720 hours along PIE
(CHANGI) BEFORE EUNOS EXIT involving our client’s vehicle registration number SLB3781G and
vehicle registration number SMP3150S driven by your insured at the material time.

As a result of the accident, our client’s vehicle has been damaged. Before our client proceed to repair
the damaged vehicle, please let us know within 2 working days of your receipt of this notice whether
you would like to conduct a pre-repair survey of the vehicle. If we do not receive any reply from you
within the stipulated timeline, our client shall proceed to repair the vehicle without further reference to
you. Kindly send us a list of survey firms to choose from.

Thank you.

We are requested to inform you that our client’s vehicle is available for pre-repair inspection at the
following address:

10 Ang Mo Kio Ind Park 2A, #03-08
AMK Autopoint
Singapore 568047

Warmest Regards,

JWG INTERNATIONAL PTE. LTD.

10, Ang Mo Kio Ind Park 2A
#03-08 AMK AutoPoint
Singapore 568047

Tel: 6909 8882 | Fax: 6909 9592

E-mail: jwg.claims@yahoo.com




