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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto)
Sent: Monday, 28 November 2022 2:20 PM
To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)
Cc: Xinya Auto
Subject: SJF 6279 - Finalize
Attachments: SJF 6279 finalize.pdf

Hi Veron, 
 
Can closed finalize. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Thanks. 
 
Best Regards, 
Steve Chen| Automotive Assessor 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 81117723/6256-3561 | email: stevenfoong@lkkauto.com| fax: 6256-4315 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

From: Xinya Auto <xinyaauto@gmail.com> 
Sent: Monday, 28 November 2022 1:34 pm 
To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: SJF 6279 - Finalize  
  
Hi, Steve  
 
After paint photo as attached 
 
thank you 
regards 
may 
 
On Thu, Nov 3, 2022 at 3:18 PM Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com> wrote: 
Hi Sir, 
 
Kindly refer our finalize $2250 (L/S, before GST).  4 days. 
 
Kindly confirm. 
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Thanks. 
 
Best Regards, 
Steve Chen| Automotive Assessor 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 8322 8813 | email: stevenfoong@lkkauto.com| fax: 6256-4315 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 


