Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 29 May 2023 5:15 PM

To: Kee Mui Hong - Ah Lim Motor @ Sin Ming; SUR
Subject: RE: Draft Finalisation - SLS3377B

Dear Mui Hong,

Without prejudice

We will be advising our principal a cost of repair of Lump Sum $2,100.00 and 2 days of repair, subject to their approval.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Kee Mui Hong - Ah Lim Motor @ Sin Ming <muihong@almsm.com.sg>
Sent: Monday, March 13, 2023 5:48 PM

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Draft Finalisation - SLS3377B

Dear Team,
Please assist to forward the draft finalisation to Adrian as car was surveyed by him but we do not have his email address.
Please assist.

Thanks !
Best Regards,

Kee Mui Hong
Ah Lim Motor @ Sin Ming
Tel : 64563637 Fax : 64563686



