Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: Meng Yan (LKK Auto)

Sent: Friday, 21 October 2022 2:48 PM

To: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore); Admin A

Cc: assignments

Subject: RE: TP DS claim: [EXT] Re: FW: Re: FW: Accident involving SMJ 5765 L & XB 8691 H on
19.10.2022

Categories: HMK

Dear Shanti,

Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards,
Yan | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 21 October 2022 12:49 PM

To: Admin A <admin-a@Ilkkauto.com>; admin-d <admin-d@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: FC GARAGE <fcgarage.claims@gmail.com>

Subject: TP DS claim: [EXT] Re: FW: Re: FW: Accident involving SMJ 5765 L & XB 8691 H on 19.10.2022

Internal

Your ref: SMJ 5765 L
Our ref: 2022 22007595FR-XB8691H

Dear Sirs,

We hereby appoint our direct settlement partners LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd to conduct survey.
Kindly engage with them to arrange for survey.

Please download the documents from this link below (For Survey)

File: CMTNF_PS.pdf, SMI5765L(TP).pdf

Link: https://filexchange.allianz.de/SecureDownload.aspx?id=a4628a68-6194-47b3-a07a-f2413a5e2e0b-d07e95a137de75a4
Size: ~ 1 MByte, Download available until: 10/26/2022

Passwords will be sent in a separate email.



Thank you.

Best regards,

Shanti. R

Claims Service

Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. | UEN 201903913C
79 Robinson Road #09-01 | Singapore 068897

Phone: +65 6395 3836 | www.allianz.sg

QQ | Alianz @ | (.

Werldwide Olympl ond Parolympic Postner

This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential and /

or privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient, please do not read, copy, use or disclose the contents of

this communication to others and notify the sender immediately. Then please delete the e-mail and any copies of it.
Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail.

From: FC GARAGE <fcgarage.claims@gmail.com>

Sent: Friday, October 21, 2022 11:24 AM

To: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>

Subject: [EXT] Re: FW: Re: FW: Accident involving SMJ 5765 L & XB 8691 H on 19.10.2022

Dear Sirs,
We would like to dominate LKK.
Thank you

On Fri, Oct 21, 2022, 11:18 AM Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg> wrote:

Internal

Your ref: SMJ 5765 L

Our ref: 2022 22007595FR-XB8691H

Dear Sirs

Enclosed is the list of surveyors for your consideration for Single Joint Expert (SJE):-

AJAX Inspection Services Pte Ltd

A-PAC Adjusters & Surveyors Pte Ltd



Form Team Consultancy Pte Ltd

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Please let us know who you are agreeable to appoint from the list.

Best regards,

Shanti.R
Claims Service

Claims & Performance Management

Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte.Ltd. | UEN 201903913C
79 Robinson Road #09-01 Singapore 068897

Phone: +65 63958973 | www.allianz.sg

Please note: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain
confidential and/or privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient, please do not read, copy, use or
disclose the contents of this communication to others and notify the sender immediately. Then please delete the e-
mail and any copies of it. Thank you.

Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail.

From: FC GARAGE <fcgarage.claims@gmail.com>
Sent: Thursday, October 20, 2022 9:09 PM




To: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>
Subject: [EXT] Re: FW: Accident involving SMJ 5765 L & XB 8691 H on 19.10.2022

Dear Sirs,

Kindly refer to the attachment, Thank you

On Thu, 20 Oct 2022 at 16:31, Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg> wrote:

Internal

Without Prejudice

Dear Sir/Madam

Kindly provide us the GIA report for us to register claim and to conduct survey.
Thank you.

Should you require any clarification or assistance, please do not hesitate to contact our Claims Department at
claims@allianz.com.sg

Best regards,

Shanti. R

Claims Service

Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. | UEN 201903913C
79 Robinson Road #09-01 | Singapore 068897

Phone: +65 6395 3836 | www.allianz.sg

I

This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential and /
or privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient, please do not read, copy, use or disclose the contents of
this communication to others and notify the sender immediately. Then please delete the e-mail and any copies of it.
Thank you.



From: FC GARAGE <fcgarage.claims@gmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, October 20, 2022 12:10 PM

To: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>
Subject: [EXT] Accident involving SMJ 5765 L & XB 8691 H on 19.10.2022

Without Prejudice

Dear Sir/ Mdm,

We refer to the above matter.

We represent our client, Grace Auto Leasing, to notify you of the aforesaid accident involving our client’s
vehicle SMJ 5765 L and your insured’s vehicle XB 8691 H on 19.10.2022

Please find enclosed our client’s GIA report for your necessary action.

This serves as a NOTICE that we are claiming against SBS 3872 G for damages, costs, and disbursements.

Please let us know within 2 working days from today, your client’s and your intention to conduct a pre-
repair survey of our client’s vehicle, along with your list of at least ten (10) motor surveyors.

If we do not receive any reply from you within the stipulated timeline, we shall proceed to appoint our own
surveyor and proceed with the necessary repair for our client’s vehicle without further reference to your
insured or you.

Premises for the Pre-repair inspection: 8 Kaki Bukit Ave 4 #04-03, Premier (@ Kaki Bukit Singapore
415875

Contact Person: FLORENCE (90110243)

Contact Email: fcgarage.claims@gamail.com




FC Garage

Florence Lee

Claim Executive

+65 9011 0243

FC Garage

Florence Lee

Claim Executive

+65 9011 0243



