Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 11 April 2023 1:03 PM

To: Ng Mei Yen

Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: AMEND : 4ND REMINDER : FINALIZE - SLH8015X
Attachments: 8015 marking .pdf; SLH 8015 FINAL.pdf

Hi Mei Yen,

COR $16,565.80, 7 days.
Subject to insurance approval

Regards
Taufikh
Lkk Auto

From: Ng Mei Yen <MeiYen.Ng@inchcape.com.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, April 5, 2023 9:54 AM

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>
Subject: AMEND : 4ND REMINDER : FINALIZE - SLH8015X

Hi Taufikh
Sorry, here attach with the amend finalize.
Kindly please help review and revert to us as soon as possible.

Thank you
MeiYen

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto) Taufikh@lkkauto.com
Sent: Friday, 31 March 2023 11:47 am

To: Ng Mei Yen <MeiYen.Ng@inchcape.com.sg>
Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@I|kkauto.com>
Subject: RE: 4AND REMINDER : FINALIZE - SLH8015X

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization (Inchcape). Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognise the sender and know the content
is safe.

Hi Mei Yen,
COR $16,429, 7 days.
Subject to insurance approval

Regards
Taufikh
Lkk Auto

From: Ng Mei Yen <MeiYen.Ng@inchcape.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, March 15, 2023 5:23 PM

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@|kkauto.com>
Subject: 4ND REMINDER : FINALIZE - SLH8015X

Hi Taufikh

Attach finalize report & before repair photos. 7 days
Can we finalize by this week?

Thank you

MeiYen

From: Ng Mei Yen

Sent: Wednesday, 15 February 2023 6:29 pm

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <taufikh@lkkauto.com>; Xin Yu (LKK Auto) <xinyu@lkkauto.com>
Subject: 3RD: REMINDER : FINALIZE - SLH8015X

Hi Taufikh
Attach finalize report & before repair photos. 7 days

Can we finalize by this week?



Thank you
MeiYen

From: Ng Mei Yen

Sent: Tuesday, 27 December 2022 3:47 pm

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <taufikh@lkkauto.com>; 'Xin Yu (LKK Auto)' <xinyu@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: REMINDER : FINALIZE - SLH8015X

Hi Taufikh

Attach finalize report & before repair photos. 7 days
Can we finalize by this week?

Thank you

MeiYen

From: Ng Mei Yen

Sent: Thursday, 24 November 2022 3:17 pm

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <taufikh@lkkauto.com>; Xin Yu (LKK Auto) <xinyu@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: FW: FINALIZE - SLH8015X

Hi Taufikh

Attach finalize report & before repair photos. 7 days
Can we finalize by this week?

Thank you

MeiYen

From: Ng Mei Yen

Sent: Tuesday, 8 November 2022 8:24 am

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <taufikh@lkkauto.com>
Subject: FINALIZE - SLH8015X

Hi Taufikh
Attach finalize report & before repair photos. 7 days

Thank you
MeiYen



