Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 7 November 2022 2:33 PM

To: Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

Subject: FW: FINALIZE SMT1847H DOA: 01.05.2022
Attachments: SMT 1847 main estimate.pdf

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 2 November 2022 9:45 AM

To: ainee@motorway.com.sg

Cc: arc@motorway.com.sg; Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>
Subject: FINALIZE SMT1847H DOA: 01.05.2022

Hi Ainee,

Kindly refer our finalize $3460.49 (P/P, before GST). 4 days.

Thanks.

Best Regards,

Steve Chen| Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 81117723/6256-3561 | email: stevenfoong@Ilkkauto.com| fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)




From: ainee@motorway.com.sg <ainee@motorway.com.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, 1 November 2022 4:56 pm

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: arc@motorway.com.sg <arc@motorway.com.sg>
Subject: FINALIZE SMT1847H DOA: 01.05.2022

Dear Steve,
Can we finalize, please find attach before paint

Thanks & Regards

Motorway Car Care Centre Pte Ltd
No. 4 Jalan Besut Sg 619557
65719642

Ainee
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