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Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

From: Huey Yon (LKKAuto)
Sent: Friday, 28 October 2022 11:29 AM
To: kawei.chia@eqinsurance.com.sg
Cc: SUR; Bryan Ang (LKKAuto); KKLau
Subject: RE: < Urgent > DM22HO01739 - SME8882M
Attachments: estimate.pdf

 
Dear Mr Chia, 
 
Refer to the tele-conversation between you and our surveyor, Kenneth. 
Kindly refer to the below parts and labour breakdown. 
 
For revised amount: 
Parts      : $248,462.00  
Labour  : $6,230.00 
Total      : $254,692.00 
 
For check items amount: 
Parts      : $56,714.50 
Labour  : $1,150.00 
Total      : $57,864.50 
 
Best Regards, 
Huey Yon | case handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte.Ltd. 
Phone: 6256-3561  Fax: 62564315  email: hueyyon@lkkauto.com 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, Singapore 408933 
 

From: Chia Ka Wei <kawei.chia@eqinsurance.com.sg> 
Sent: Thursday, 27 October 2022 3:58 pm 
To: KKLau <kklau@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: < Urgent > DM22HO01739 - SME8882M  
  
Dear Sirs, 
  
Please inform Kenneth urgently to hold on OD claim authorization to Optima. We have just revoked in Merimen already. 
  
Can ask him to call me if possible. 
  
Announcement 
  
As we endeavour to keep everyone safe, our business will continue to operate within Covid-19 SMM guidelines. Although our Customer Care Counter 
remain closed till further notice, we can be reached via phone, email or an arranged video call meeting.  For any onsite customer care service, 
including meetings - in EQI premises - a prior agreed appointment can be arranged.    
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Regards,  
 
Chia Ka Wei  
Senior Manager | Claims 

  

 

  
EQ Insurance Company Limited  
 

5 Maxwell Road  #17-00  Tower Block  MND Complex  Singapore 069110  

          

did 65 6496 9889 | tel 65 6223 9433 ext 889 | fax 65 6223 4190 
www.eqinsurance.com.sg         
  

 

  
Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender immediately and delete all copies of it.        
 

  
  


