¥in's Motor Pte Lid

160 Sin Ming Drive

#03-03 Sin Ming Autocity
Singapore 575722

Tel : 6453 2121 Fax : 6455 9735
GST Registration Mo, 199906067G

Qur Ref: TP/092022/5627

Your Ref: SLF1188L

11-02-2023

Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte Ltd

79 Robinson Road
#08-01
Singapore 068897

Dear SirfMdm,

Accident Involving Vehicles : YQ1582U & SLF1188L

Along : SLIP ROAD TOWARDS ANG MO KIO AVENUE 3 NEAR
INDUSTRIAL PARK 2

DOA : 08-09-2022

We are the authorized repair workshop for the owner of motor vehicle no: YQ1582U, which was involved in the captioned accident with your
insured vehicle: SLF1188L. The vehicle owner has requested and authorized us fo assist him in presenting his/her claim against the party
responsible for the damage to the vehicle.

As the accident was caused by the negligent act of your insured driving, we are submitting these claims for your consideration on behalf of the
owner/claimant.

1 Cost of Repair (Inclusive of GST) $2,376.00
(COR $2,200.00 + GST §176.00)
2) Loss of Use_3 working days for repairing x $180 $540.00
3) Loss of Use_1 day wait for surveyor x $180 $180.00
4) Loss of Use_1 cross Sunday x $180 $180.00
5) Search Fee $2.00
$3,278.00

We enclosed herewith the following documents to support the claims:-

a} Letter of Authorisation / GIA report(s} / Insurance Certificate, efc...
b} Final Repair Bill
c) GlA search/ Car Rental Bill & Invoice

Kindly look into the matter and let us hear from you on the setflement of our customer's claims as soon as possible.

Please note that it is a condition of any settiement reached that it shall be without prejudice to any personal injury claim {if any) of the
owner/claimant.

This is a computer-generated document. No signature is required. Please issue Payment / Cheque to: Vin's Motor
Pte Lid

Please transfer to: Vin's Motor Pie Lid
UOB Current Account
AJC No: 451-307-638-4
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¥in's Motor Pte Lid

160 Sin Ming Drive

#03-03 Sin Ming Autocity
Singapors 575722

Tel : 6453 2121 Fax : 6459 9795
GST Registration No. 1899060676

Tax Invoice
Attention To . Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte [nvoice Details
Ltd Invoice No. © VM-C-202302-11115
79 Robinson Road Date < 41-02-2023
#09-01
Singapore 068897
Claim Details
Make & Model : Hino XZU710R 14FT WIDE CAB ’
5T
Chassis No : JHHUCV3HE0K032962 Third Partv Vehicle Details
Registration No : YQ1582U Registration No : SLF1188L

1 TOTAL AMOUNT AGREED AS AT LUMP SUM REPAIR

$2,200.00

Payment Information: Subtotal wlo GST: $2,200.00

BUOB GST (8%): $176.00

Payment / Cheque to issue: s eren o Subtotal: $2,376.00
Vin's Motor Pte Lid fni Deposit:

Bank - UOB Account: 451-307-638-4 Balance Due: $2,376.00

Paynow UEN: 199906067G

Arnount in words:
Two Thousand Three Hundred Seventy Six Only.

Issued by Shairul Akmal Bin Abd Razak

This is a computer-generated document. No signature is required.

1of1



08/08/2022, 13:21

INSURER ENQUIRY
Find insurer

Vehicle reg. no.

SLF1188L

Date of Accident

08/09/2022 &

Reset

hitps:/iwww.gears.com.sg/insurer-enquiry

Insurer Enquiry — GEARS

7% RESULT & RECEIPT
TP Insurer Enquiry
Insurance Allianz Insurance Singapore P...
Period of Insurance 28/10/2021-27/10/2022
Requested By Raymond Teo Yun Loong {Vin'...
Requested Date 08/09/2022 13:21
Payment details General Insurance Association
Request Amount: $$1.87 Records Management Centre
GST Amount: $50.13 GST Registration No: M460017735

Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive): 352
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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: VAuUG Claims <claims@vinsautogroup.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 5 May 2023 2:26 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: Re: YQ1582U - ALLIANZ TP - DOA: 8/9/2022 - YR REF: SLF1188L - Letter of Demand
*** KK REF: CC4/A1S22010397/Gpa3

Attachments: Bank Acc Details Letter Head.pdf

Good afternoon,
Kindly refer the attached bank details.

Thanks & Best Regards,
Kiara

Sin Ming AutoCity

160 Sin Ming Drive

Singapore 575722

Claims Office: #03-03

Workshops: #08-08/09/10

Tel: 64532121

Fax: 64599795

Website: www.vinsautogroup.com.sg
Email: claims@vinsautogroup.com.sg

Follow us on :

EIEIEI ETET

** w.e.f 15th May 2017, we have shifted location! **
** w.e.f 20th November 2017, we have changed our email address! **
** w.e.f 28th June 2022, our head office have shifted to 20 Sin Ming Lane #06-65/66 Singapore 573968 **

On Tue, 11 Apr 2023 at 16:46, Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> wrote:

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’

SAVE AS TO COSTS

Dear Sirs

Solely for purposes of amicable settlement, we are agreeable to resolve the matter at $$2,858.00 (all in) in full and
final settlement of all claims your client has or may have against Allianz Insurance Singapore and/or their insured
arising out of this incident.



If the above offer is accepted, kindly confirm settlement by providing a copy of your Bank details for us to process
payment.

Please note that your client’s receipt of the settlement sum or settlement sums shall constitute a full discharge of
liability and waiver of any past, present or future claims your client may have against Allianz Insurance Singapore
and/or our insured as a result of the accident on 08 Sept 2022.

Please note that the clearance of this cheque / settlement sum or receipt of the successful electronic payment or
payments constitutes your client’s acceptance of payment and full discharge of liability.

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
S(408933)

From: VAuG Claims <claims@vinsautogroup.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, April 5, 2023 3:46 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Re: YQ1582U - ALLIANZ TP - DOA: 8/9/2022 - YR REF: SLF1188L - Letter of Demand *** LKK REF:
CC4/AIS22010397/Gpa3

Good afternoon,

We accept the offer.



\(i{n'S

AUTOMOTIVE GROUP

Bank Account Details

Sin Ming Autocity,
160 Sin Ming Drive #03-03
Singapore 575722

6453 2121 (4 lines)/ 6458 1111 (24 hrs)
6459 9795/ 6459 0433
admin@vinsautogroup.com.sg

www.vinsautogroup.com.sg

Payee (Name of your Company)

Vin’s Motor Pte Ltd

Name of Bank

United Overseas Bank

Account No.

4513076384

Email address

claims@vinsautogroup.com.sg

Officer’s Signature/Company Stamp: j@

Name: lzzah Atirah

Position: Accounts Executive

VIN'S MOTOR PTE LTD | REGISTRATION & GST NO: 199906067G



Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 9 November 2022 12:50 PM

To: humblez88@hotmail.com

Subject: CLAIM NOTIFICATION - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLF1188L(ALLIANZ) AND YQ1582U

AT/ALONG ANG MO KIO AVE 3 ON 08/09/2022

LEE CHERN SIN, BENEDICT [By Email Only]
DRIVER: LIM MEI HUI, DAPHNE

Dear Sir/Madam,

You Ref: SLF1188L
Our Ref: CC4/A1S22010397/Gpa3
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLF1188L(ALLIANZ) AND YQ1582U AT/ALONG ANG MO KIO AVE 3 ON 08/09/2022

We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed by your
motor insurer, Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd to deal with the third party claim against your policy.

We have received a claim from YQ1582U against your insurance policy.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, we are of the view that liability is not in your driver’s favour.
Therefore, we shall proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement of the third-party claim at best to avoid further
litigation, which would escalate to even more cost.

Please be informed that your No Claim Discount (NCD) may be affected as a result of the claim against your policy.

As Insurers, they shall proceed to deal with the claim(s) subject to the merits of the case and according to the rights
afforded under the policy. Should you not be seeking the protection of your policy and seek to take conduct of third
party claim(s) arising from this incident, at your own cost and defence, please reply to us within 7 days from the
date of this letter. Your intent must be formally expressed to Allianz and acknowledged by Allianz.

To protect your interest(s) in the handling of this claim, please do not discuss liability with any of the Third Party(s)
and/or their legal representatives, or make any compromise or settlement without our prior knowledge and
consent. If you receive any correspondence or legal document such as a Writ of Summons in connection with this
accident, please forward it to us immediately. You may email it to customerservice@allianz.com.sg or deliver it by
hand to Allianz Customer Care Centre.

This letter should not be regarded as a waiver by Allianz of their rights to repudiate any claim because of any breach
of policy terms and conditions you and/or your authorised driver may have committed.

In the event of receiving and handling of any third-party injury claim(s), we shall keep you informed of the final
indemnity upon conclusion of the matter(s).

If you need any clarification, please do not hesitate to contact as at 6742 3197 or chewht@Ikkauto.com.

Thank you.



Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
S(408933)
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