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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)
Sent: Friday, 9 December 2022 11:38 AM
To: Dennis Leong; Steve Chen (LKK Auto); SUR
Cc: LKINSTEAM
Subject: RE: PENDING REPAIR COST - SNA2148Z-DOA: 14/10/2022

Dear Dennis, 
 
 
“Without Prejudice” 
 
We will be advising our Principal a cost of repair of $2548.80/- with 3 days of repair, subject to their 
approval.  
 
 
 
 
 
Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 
 

From: Dennis Leong <dennisleong@motorimage.net>  
Sent: Wednesday, 7 December 2022 4:52 PM 
To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>; Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: LKINSTEAM <LKINSTEAM@tanchong.org> 
Subject: RE: PENDING REPAIR COST - SNA2148Z 
 
Hi Veron, 
 
Our COR computation is attached for your agreement.  
 
COR: $2548.80 before GST. 
 
03 repair days (not including preparation of estimate, wait for survey/authorization/spare parts, 
Sat/Sun/PH). 
 
Kindly confirm the above as soon as possible. 
 
***Kindly reply to all for easier follow-up*** 
 
Best Regards. 
 
DENNIS LEONG 
 
Insurance Claim  
Motor Image Enterprises Pte Ltd 



2

25 Leng Kee Road 
Singapore 159097 
DID: (65) 6703 8164 
HP: (65) 9489 9000  
Email: dennisleong@motorimage.net 
 
 
 

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Friday, 4 November 2022 4:49 pm 
To: Dennis Leong <dennisleong@motorimage.net>; Jeff Teh Teng Chuen <tengchuen@motorimage.net> 
Subject: PENDING REPAIR COST 
 
Dear Sir, 
 
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
 
Kindly advise vehicle status. 
 
If vehicle has been repaired, please finalize with us.  
 

1) SLH 5890E-DOA:30/5/2022 
2) SMQ 7869X-DOA: 4/10/2022 
3) SNA 2148Z-DOA: 14/10/2022 

 
 
 
Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 
 
 

 
 
 
Disclaimer: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee you may not copy, forward, disclose or 
use any part of this message. If you have received this message in error, please delete it and all copies from your system and notify the 
sender immediately by return e-mail. Internet communications cannot be guaranteed to be timely, secure, error-free or virus-free. The 
sender does not accept liability for any errors or omissions.  


