Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: enquiry@sh-motor.com

Sent: Tuesday, 23 May 2023 12:00 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: Accident Involving our vehicle no : SLZ8138E claiming TP vehicle no : YP1123S
D.O.A. 15/10/2022 *** LKK REF: CC4/AIS22010358/pa3

Attachments: LOA SLZ8138E.pdf

Hi Ms Chew,

We confirmed accept the offer at $3170.00 .
Attached signed LOA by owner. Kindly arrange payment to S & H Motor,

Pls find below bank details :-

Name of Bank : UOB

Bank Swift Code : UOVBSGSG

Account Number : 105 307 668 3

Account Holder’s Name : S & H Motor Pte Ltd

Regards,

Regine .Y

S & H Motor Pte Ltd

T :+6564534730

E :regine@sh-motor.com

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, May 22, 2023 2:57 PM

To: enquiry@sh-motor.com

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Accident Involving our vehicle no : SLZ8138E claiming TP vehicle no : YP1123S D.0O.A. 15/10/2022 ***
LKK REF: CC4/AIS22010358/pa3

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICF’
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Dear Sirs,

Solely for purposes of amicable settlement, we are agreeable to resolve the matter at $$3,170.00(all in) in full and
final settlement of all claims your client has or may have against Allianz Insurance Singapore and/or their insured
arising out of this incident.

If the above offer is accepted, kindly confirm settlement by providing a copy of the Letter of Authorization /
Warrant to Act and your Bank details for us to process payment.

Please note that your client’s receipt of the settlement sum or settlement sums shall constitute a full discharge of
liability and waiver of any past, present or future claims your client may have against Allianz Insurance Singapore
and/or our insured as a result of the accident on 15 OCT 2022.



Please note that the clearance of this cheque / settlement sum or receipt of the successful electronic payment or
payments constitutes your client’s acceptance of payment and full discharge of liability.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)

From: enquiry@sh-motor.com <enquiry@sh-motor.com>

Sent: Monday, May 22, 2023 1:48 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Accident Involving our vehicle no : SLZ8138E claiming TP vehicle no : YP1123S D.O.A. 15/10/2022 ***
LKK REF: CC4/AIS22010358/pa3

Hi Ms Chew ,
Is the DV issue from your side or Allianz ?

Regards,

Regine .Y

S & H Motor Pte Ltd

T :+6564534730

E :regine@sh-motor.com

From: Enquiry <enquiry@sh-motor.com>

Sent: Thursday, March 23, 2023 2:57 PM

To: 'Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)' <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Accident Involving our vehicle no : SLZ8138E claiming TP vehicle no : YP1123S D.O.A. 15/10/2022 ***
LKK REF: CC4/AIS22010358/pa3

Dear Ms Chew,

We agree this offer. Please send us a DV.

Thank you & Best Regards,

You Qing
S&H MOTOR PTE LTD

160 Sin Ming Drive #07-02
Sing Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722
Tel: 6453 4730 Fax: 64571931



