Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 18 April 2023 1:33 PM
To: SUR; CS A Team

Subject: FW: GIA Report: SKA8805G

From: benedict yap <detail.lab@gmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 18 April 2023 1:32:12 pm (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore
To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: GIA Report: SKA8805G

Dear Taufikh

Agreed at $6450, DOR 03 days.

Will submit our LOD to China Taiping directly.
Regards

Ben

Detail Lab

On Tue, Apr 18, 2023 at 11:53 AM Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Hi Ben,

Please refer attached, COR I/s $6450, 3 days.

Subject to insurance approval.

Regards
Taufikh

Lkk Auto

From: benedict yap <detail.lab@gmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, November 29, 2022 8:44 AM

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>; detaillab admin <detaillab.001 @gmail.com>
Subject: Re: GIA Report: SKA8805G

Dear Taufikh

Attached workshop estimate for SKA8805G for your finalization.

Thanks

Ben

On Sat, Oct 22, 2022 at 10:10 AM benedict yap <detail.lab@gmail.com> wrote:

Dear Taufikh

Attached GIA report for your reference.



Should you require further queries or clarifications, please do not hesitate to contact me.

Best Regards

Ben Yap
Detail Lab
Swissvax Singapore

mobile: 9844 8533

Should you require further queries or clarifications, please do not hesitate to contact me.

Best Regards

Ben Yap
Detail Lab
Swissvax Singapore

mobile: 9844 8533

Should you require further queries or clarifications, please do not hesitate to contact me.

Best Regards

Ben Yap

Detail Lab

8 Kaki Bukit Ave 4 #02-03 Premier@Kaki Bukit
Singapore 415875

UEN: 53162183M

mobile: 9844 8533



