Celine Fong (LKKAuto)

From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

Sent: Tuesday, 8 November 2022 7:28 PM

To: Celine Fong (LKKAuto)

Subject: SKX 5024S Finalize calculation and discharge photos
Attachments: SKX 5024 main estimate1.pdf

Hi Celine.

Can closed.

Thanks.

Best Regards,

Steve Chen| Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 81117723/6256-3561 | email: stevenfoong@Ilkkauto.com| fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Ong Hock Kong <hk.ong@mova.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 8 November 2022 5:30 pm

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: 'Suann' <suann@mova.com.sg>; 'Jia Yu' <jiayu@mova.com.sg>; 'keesiokkiang' <keesiokkiang@mova.com.sg>
Subject: RE: SKX 5024S Finalize calculation and discharge photos

Dear Steve,
We accept your offer L/Sum @ $3600.00 with 4 days.
Thank You.

Best Regards,
Ong

From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) [mailto:SteveChen@lkkauto.com]
Sent: Tuesday, 8 November 2022 5:01 PM

To: Ong Hock Kong

Cc: 'Suann'; 'Jia Yu'; 'keesiokkiang'

Subject: SKX 5024S Finalize calculation and discharge photos

Hi Ong,



Kindly refer our finalize $3600 (L/S, before GST). 4 days.

Kindly confirm.

Thanks.

Best Regards,

Steve Chen| Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 81117723/6256-3561 | email: stevenfoong@Ilkkauto.com| fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Ong Hock Kong <hk.ong@mova.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 8 November 2022 3:51 pm

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: 'Suann' <suann@mova.com.sg>; 'Jia Yu' <jiayu@mova.com.sg>; 'keesiokkiang' <keesiokkiang@mova.com.sg>
Subject: SKX 5024S Finalize calculation and discharge photos

Dear Steve,

Attached finalize calculation and discharge photos for your attention.
Kindly assist to finalize as vehicle been discharged.

Thank You.

Best Regards,
Ong



