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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Tan Lee Gek (Strides Automotive Services Pte Ltd) <LeeGek.Tan@strides.com.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, 14 December 2022 2:54 PM
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Cc: Admin A
Subject: LOD   LKK Ref: CC4/ASM22010316/Rpa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHC3306M(AXA) 

AND SHB5931A ON 18/10/2022]   Our Ref: TAX/10/22/2060/lg
Attachments: SHB5931A - documents.pdf; SAS report of SHB5931A.pdf; SHB5931A-video.mp4

Dear Hsiao Tong, 
  
We quantify our own losses as follows:-  
       
Cost of Repair $18,492.73           
Loss of Rental $2,377.54 ( 22 days x $108.07 ) 
Total $20,870.27           

 
We enclose the following documents:-  

1) Repair invoice  
2) Proof of rental rate 
3) SAS report  
4) Accident vehicle laid-up report 
  

Our hirer is claiming his injury and loss of income through his own lawyer.  
 
Please acknowledge receipt within 14 days from the date hereof and let us have your offer soon. Thanks. 
 
Regards 
Tan Lee Gek (DID: 6556 3548) 
Claims Department 
STRIDES Automotive Services Pte Ltd  
 

 
 

From: Tan Lee Gek (Strides Automotive Services Pte Ltd)  
Sent: Wednesday, 9 November 2022 3:40 pm 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Your Ref: SHB5931A //LKK Ref: CC4/ASM22010316/Rpa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHC3306M(AXA) AND 
SHB5931A ON 18/10/2022] Our Ref: TAX/10/22/2060/lg 
 
Dear Hsiao Tong, 
 
We attached the video footage as requested. Based on your insured’s report, it is obvious that he had beat the red 
light.    
 
Regards 
Tan Lee Gek (DID: 6556 3548) 
Claims Department 
STRIDES Automotive Services Pte Ltd  
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From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, 9 November 2022 12:47 pm 
To: Tan Lee Gek (Strides Automotive Services Pte Ltd) <LeeGek.Tan@strides.com.sg> 
Subject: Your Ref: SHB5931A //LKK Ref: CC4/ASM22010316/Rpa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHC3306M(AXA) AND 
SHB5931A ON 18/10/2022] 
 
Your Ref: SHB5931A                                                        Without Prejudice 
LKK Ref: CC4/ASM22010316/Rpa3 
 
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHC3306M(AXA) AND SHB5931A ON 18/10/2022 
 
We refer to the above matter.  
 
Attached is a copy of our insured accident report for your easy reference. 
 
We would like to request for a copy of your client’s video footage for our viewing. 
 
Appreciate an early reply. 
 
 
 

Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

 





23/02/2023

79,995.23
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