Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From:
Sent:
To:

Cc:
Subject:

Hi Veron,

DOA is confirmed on 12/10/2022.

Regards,

Chen How

Ng Chen How <chenhow.ng@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Thursday, 2 February 2023 9:04 AM

Veron Chen (LKKAuto); Claims; admin-d; SUR; assignments

Derrick Quok; Kenneth Lim

RE: TPPD survey: Claim ref: C10018011/CH || OI- SGC8179S (Black) TP- SMM7078H ||
Est: $0.00 || Xin Hua Workshop

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 2 February 2023 8:59 am

To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>; admin-d <admin-d@Ikkauto.com>; SUR <sur@I|kkauto.com>;
assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Ng Chen How <chenhow.ng@budgetdirect.com.sg>; Derrick Quok <derrick.q@budgetdirect.com.sg>; Kenneth
Lim <kenneth.lim@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Subject: RE: TPPD survey: Claim ref: CL0018011/CH || OI- SGC8179S (Black) TP- SMM7078H | | Est: $0.00 | | Xin Hua

Workshop

Dear Salizawati,

Kindly confirmed DOA as TP gia stated 12.10.2022.

Best Regards,
Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 17 October 2022 11:22 AM
To: admin-d <admin-d@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; assignments <assignments@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Chen How Ng <chenhow.ng@budgetdirect.com.sg>; Derrick Quok <derrick.q@budgetdirect.com.sg>; Kenneth

Lim <kenneth.lim@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Subject: TPPD survey: Claim ref: C10018011/CH || Ol- SGC8179S (Black) TP- SMM7078H || Est: $0.00 | | Xin Hua

Workshop

Hi Team

We wish to appoint LKK to conduct survey for the TP vehicle number: SMM7078H
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Xin Hua Workshop
No 23 Kaki Bukit Ave 4, #04-01 (South Wing), Vicom Kaki Bukit Inspection Centre, Singapore 415933

Contact: Kelvin - 8292 5595
Please find attached GIA reports for your reference.
TP not yet make the reporting.

Best regards,

Salizawati Haizar
Admin Executive, Claims

F +65 6725 0853
E salizawati.h@budgetdirect.com.sg

Platinum
Trusted
Service

It pays to choose
Budget
Direct

insurance

For consistentl:

2022 feefo®®

From: Xin Hua <xinhuaworkshopl@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, 17 October 2022 10:40 am

To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Cc: Chen How Ng <chenhow.ng@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Subject: Re: PRI Request on 15.10.2022 || Ourf: C10018011/CH | | ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMM7078H & SGC8179S
ON 11.10.2022

Dear Salizawati,

Kindly please let LKK survey our client vehicle.
Thanks.

From
Kelvin
8292 5595

From: Xin Hua <xinhuaworkshopl@gmail.com>

Sent: Saturday, 15 October 2022 1:51 pm

To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMM7078H & SGC8179S ALONG OUTSIDE CAR PARK 921A TAMPINES ST 91 ON
11.10.2022/ 0640

To the officer in charge:

We are appointed workshop bearing the car plates SMM7078H ,accident happened due to the collision by your
insured SSGC8179S .



Kindly help to arrange for PRI at the following address:

Xinhua workshop
Reg:201838521G

No 23,kaki bukit ave 4,
#04-01(south wing)

S(415933)

Regards,

ALLAN

87867171

‘Without Prejudice ”



