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Meng Yan (LKK Auto)

From: Meng Yan (LKK Auto)
Sent: Monday, 17 October 2022 10:25 AM
To: Romeo Jonnalyn Alaan; assignments; SUR
Subject: RE: URGENT!! PL-UNITED E & P PTE LTD-PLY/22-PL000810-R002-INSURED'S MACHINE 

KNOCKED INTO VEH NO. SMX3733T-DOA 05/10/2022   -  HLAS's REF: PLC01062/JG

Dear Lynn Romeo, 
 
Thank you for the assignment. 
 
 

Best Regards, 

Yan | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com  | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

From: Romeo Jonnalyn Alaan <Jonnalyn.Romeo@hlas.com.sg>  
Sent: Monday, 17 October 2022 9:30 AM 
To: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: AIM Admin Support <automim.ops@gmail.com> 
Subject: URGENT!! PL-UNITED E & P PTE LTD-PLY/22-PL000810-R002-INSURED'S MACHINE KNOCKED INTO VEH NO. 
SMX3733T-DOA 05/10/2022 - HLAS's REF: PLC01062/JG 
Importance: High 
 
Dear LKK, 
 
New assignment. Kindly arrange. Thank you! 
 
Best Regards, 
Lynn Romeo 
Claims Department 
 

 
11 Keppel Road #11-01, ABI Plaza, Singapore 089057 
T +65 6922 6025 | F +65 6221 3782 
jonnalyn.romeo@hlas.com.sg | www.hlas.com.sg 
Reaching out to you at Facebook|Twitter|Linkedin| 
 
From: AIM Admin Support [mailto:automim.ops@gmail.com]  
Sent: Thursday, 13 October 2022 3:40 pm 
To: Romeo Jonnalyn Alaan <Jonnalyn.Romeo@hlas.com.sg> 
Cc: alexwong@ajaxadjusters.com; admin@ajaxadjusters.com 
Subject: Re: Damaged to SMS3733T on 5 Oct 2022 - HLAS's REF: PLC01062/JG 
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Hi Alex  
 
We would like to select LKK for your PRS  
 
Thank you  
 

 
Automobile Integrated Management Pte Ltd 
Mailing Address: 61 Ubi Ave 2 #07-04 Automobile Megamart Singapore 408898 
Workshop Address: 23 Kaki Bukit Ave 4, Kaki Bukit Vicom #04-01 (South Wing) Singapore 415933 
Tel: 91198371  www.aimgarage.com.sg 
 
 
On Thu, Oct 13, 2022 at 3:38 PM Romeo Jonnalyn Alaan <Jonnalyn.Romeo@hlas.com.sg> wrote: 

Dear Alex, 

  

Will send our policy documents in a while, for now please assist on the pre-survey. Thanks! 

  

Best Regards, 

Lynn Romeo 

Claims Department 

  

 

11 Keppel Road #11-01, ABI Plaza, Singapore 089057 
T +65 6922 6025 | F +65 6221 3782 
jonnalyn.romeo@hlas.com.sg | www.hlas.com.sg 
Reaching out to you at Facebook|Twitter|Linkedin| 

  

  

From: AIM Admin Support [mailto:automim.ops@gmail.com]  
Sent: Thursday, 13 October 2022 3:26 pm 
To: HLAS Claims <claims@hlas.com.sg> 
Subject: Re: Damaged to SMS3733T on 5 Oct 2022 - HLAS's REF: PLC01062/JG 
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Hi Alex  

  

Kindly expedite my client's claim 

  

Thank you  
 

 

Automobile Integrated Management Pte Ltd 

Mailing Address: 61 Ubi Ave 2 #07-04 Automobile Megamart Singapore 408898 

Workshop Address: 23 Kaki Bukit Ave 4, Kaki Bukit Vicom #04-01 (South Wing) Singapore 415933 

Tel: 91198371  www.aimgarage.com.sg 

  

  

On Thu, Oct 13, 2022 at 3:20 PM HLAS Claims <claims@hlas.com.sg> wrote: 

Dear Alex, 

  

For your handling please. Thank you. 

  

Best Regards, 

Lynn Romeo 

Claims Department 
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11 Keppel Road #11-01, ABI Plaza, Singapore 089057 
T +65 6922 6025 | F +65 6221 3782 
jonnalyn.romeo@hlas.com.sg | www.hlas.com.sg 
Reaching out to you at Facebook|Twitter|Linkedin| 

  

---------- Forwarded message --------- 
From: AIM Admin Support <automim.ops@gmail.com> 
Date: Mon, Oct 10, 2022 at 11:23 AM 
Subject: Fwd: Damaged to SMS3733T on 5 Oct 2022 
To: <chanswee.koh@uep.com.sg> 

  

  

Dear Sir / Madam, 

  

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMS3733T & MACHINERY ALONG 99 JALAN JARAK SELETAR 
HILLS ESTATE SINGAPORE 809251 ON 5/10/2022 

CLAIMANT: AMELIA LIM JIA MIN (OWNER OF SMS3733T) 
 
We are appointed by Ms Amelia Lim Jia Min to claim damages against your Company in connection with the 
above mentioned accident involving your Company's machinery operated by your worker. 

 
We are instructed that the accident was caused by your operator. As a result, our client's vehicle has been 
damaged.  

  

Before we proceed to repair the damaged vehicle, please let us know within two (2) working days whether 
you or your insurer would like to conduct a pre-repair survey of the vehicle. If we do not receive any reply 
from you within the stipulated timeline, we shall proceed to repair the vehicle and send you the invoice 
without further reference to you. 

  

  

Thank & regards  
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Automobile Integrated Management Pte Ltd 

Mailing Address: 61 Ubi Ave 2 #07-04 Automobile Megamart Singapore 408898 

Workshop Address: 23 Kaki Bukit Ave 4, Kaki Bukit Vicom #04-01 (South Wing) Singapore 415933 

Tel: 91198371  www.aimgarage.com.sg 

 
 

  

--  

Thank you and have a nice day. 

  

Warmest regards, 

  

(Ms) Cassie Tan 

Senior HR Executive 

聯和資源私人有限公司 
UNITED E & P PTE. LTD. 
25 First Lok Yang Road 
Singapore 629734. 
DID: 6470 9564   Fax: 6264 2525 
UEN No. 201319590G   GST No. 201319590G 

  


