Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 29 November 2022 9:16 AM

To: Seah, Andy; Meng Yan (LKK Auto); assignments; SUR

Cc: Seah, Ted; Work Shop Estimate (SG)

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSIGNMENT FOR 13/10/2022-SMF 1710S BVS22/1288-SL

Attachments: SMF1710S wheel alignement (B4)_compressed.pdf; SMF1710S wheel alignment
(AFT).pdf

Dear Andy,

Attach wheel alignment report.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Seah, Andy <Seah.Andy®@libertyinsurance.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 28 November 2022 8:05 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>; Meng Yan (LKK Auto) <mengyan@Ikkauto.com>;
assignments <assignments@Ilkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@Ilkkauto.com>

Cc: Seah, Ted <seah.ted@libertyinsurance.com.sg>; Work Shop Estimate (SG)
<workshopestimate@libertyinsurance.com.sg>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSIGNMENT FOR 13/10/2022-SMF 1710S BVS22/1288-SL

Dear Veron

Kindly provide alignment report for undercarraige part replacement.



LRAADIID. NLELS1DLL1LVLT (£LUVUD)

S/N Qty Items o U/price Amour
1 1 FRONTBUMPER [V < $864.00 $864.00
2 1  FRONT BUMPER REINFORCEMENT VT ¢c~ $385.00 $385.00 -
3 1 LH FRONT BUMPER FOG LAMP COVER ™ $95.00 $95.00 -
4 1 LH FRONT BUMPER SIDE RETAINER *~ 4 $58.00 $58.00 -
5 1 LH FRONT FENDER Defed . $735.00 ($735:00 -
6 1 LHFRONT FENDER INNER COWLING To/e $176.00 $176.00
7 1 LHFRONT FENDER LAMP /© T “— $48.00 $48.00
8 1 BONNET 8 $951.00 $951.00
9 1 LHFRONT HEADLAMP  /ze.c $890.00 $890.00
10 1 LHFRONTHEADLAMP LOWER BRACKET A<« $76.00 $76.00
11 1 LHFRONTLOWERARM Bt $428.00 ($428.08—
12 1 LHFRONTKNUCKLER ARM  ~o~ypd 5548.00 §548.00 4
13 1 LHFRONT KNUCKLER ARM BEARING T $289.00 $289.00 -
14 1 LHFRONTSHOCK ABSORBER /T #- $544.00 $544.00 |
Thanks

Best Regards

ANDY SEAH

Claim Department

Liberty Insurance Pte Ltd

51 Club Street #03-00 Liberty House
Singapore 069428

DID: (65) 63280767
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From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Monday, November 28, 2022 1:05 PM

To: Meng Yan (LKK Auto) <mengyan@Ikkauto.com>; Seah, Andy <Seah.Andy®@libertyinsurance.com.sg>;

assighments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Seah, Ted <seah.ted@libertyinsurance.com.sg>; Work Shop Estimate (SG)

<workshopestimate@libertyinsurance.com.sg>

Subject: {EXTERNAL} RE: SURVEY ASSIGNMENT FOR 13/10/2022-SMF 1710S

Dear Andy,

Enclosed preliminary revised for SMF 1710S

Kindly provides us claim number



Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 14 October 2022 10:54 AM

To: Meng Yan (LKK Auto) <mengyan@lkkauto.com>; Seah, Andy <Seah.Andy@libertyinsurance.com.sg>;
assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Seah, Ted <seah.ted@libertyinsurance.com.sg>; Work Shop Estimate (SG)
<workshopestimate@libertyinsurance.com.sg>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSIGNMENT FOR 13/10/2022

Dear Andy,
Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle SMF 1710S on 13/10/2022.

We are pending estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 13 October 2022 10:45 AM

To: Seah, Andy <Seah.Andy@libertyinsurance.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; SUR
<sur@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Seah, Ted <seah.ted@libertyinsurance.com.sg>; Work Shop Estimate (SG)
<workshopestimate@libertyinsurance.com.sg>

Subject: Re: SURVEY ASSIGNMENT FOR 13/10/2022

Dear Andy,

Thank you for the assignment.



Best Regards,

Yan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Seah, Andy <Seah.Andy®@Ilibertyinsurance.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 12 October 2022 6:03 pm

To: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>; SUR
<sur@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Seah, Ted <seah.ted@libertyinsurance.com.sg>; Work Shop Estimate (SG)
<workshopestimate@libertyinsurance.com.sg>

Subject: SURVEY ASSIGNMENT FOR 13/10/2022

Dear Celine and Yan

Kindly assist to Survey the following vehicle mentioned below.

LKK Auto Cons
S/N Workshop Address Contact no.
1 | MY CAR CONSULTANT PTE LTD 60 JALAN LAM HUAT,CARROS CTR #05-68 93911482 DAUD
2 | SM AUTOMOTIVE 1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 Blk C #01-43 6747 9241 SUKI

Thanks.

Best Regards,
Andy Seah

Claim Department

Liberty Insurance Pte Ltd

51 Club Street #03-00 Liberty House
Singapore 069428

DID: (65) 63280767
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