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Xin Yu  (LKK Auto)

From: Li Feng ANG (SCDF) <ANG_Li_Feng@scdf.gov.sg>
Sent: Thursday, January 12, 2023 5:30 PM
To: Xin Yu  (LKK Auto)
Subject: RE: New Fire Report Application - FR2022101708755_Incident//20221010/0869_171 

Paya Lebar Rd, Singapore 409048
Attachments: PRR_Pdf_Along Paya Lebar Road (GBA9564B).pdf

Message Classification: Confidential 
 
Dear Sir/Madam,  
 
              Thank you for your request and payment of $170.00 via Credit/Debit Card.  I have enclosed the fire report. 
 
2.           Do note that SCDF Fire Report is meant to facilitate insurance claims.  
 
3.           It would state the probable cause of fire as well as the damages sustained. The fire report does not 
apportion blame or assign liability.  
 
4.           If you have any enquiries regarding the report, please liaise with me at this email address, 
Ang_Li_Feng@scdf.gov.sg. I can also be contacted at Tel No. 68483345. 
 
5.           Thank you. 
 
Your sincerely, 
 
CPT Ang Li Feng  
Fire Investigator 
Operations Department | Fire Investigation Unit  
Singapore Civil Defence Force  
DID: (65) 6848 3345 

    
Singapore Civil Defence Force   W SCDF.gov.sg FB fb.com/SCDFpage IG Instagram.com/mySCDF 
 

From: Md Arriffin YUSOPE (SCDF) <Md_Arriffin_YUSOPE@scdf.gov.sg>  
Sent: 18 October 2022 16:42 
To: xinyu@lkkauto.com 
Cc: Li Feng ANG (SCDF) <ANG_Li_Feng@scdf.gov.sg> 
Subject: FW: New Fire Report Application - FR2022101708755_Incident//20221010/0869_171 Paya Lebar Rd, 
Singapore 409048 
 
Dear Sir/Madam, 
 

We acknowledged your application dated 18/10/2022 for a copy of the fire report with the following details. (LKK Auto is 

Representing Ergo Insurance company) 

a. Transaction Number      :           FR2022101708755 
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b. Incident Number            :           /20221010/0869 

c. Incident Location           :           171 Paya Lebar Rd, Singapore 409048 

Please be informed that the fire incident is still under investigation and has not concluded. 
Once the fire investigation is completed, we will proceed to process your application for the fire report. 

 
Thank you and best regards 

 
SWO MOHD ARRIFFIN BIN YUSOPE 
FIRE INVESTIGATOR 
Fire Investigation Unit | Operations Department 
HQ Singapore Civil Defence Force 
DID: (65) 6848 3349| FAX: (65) 6848 3368 

    
Singapore Civil Defence Force   W SCDF.gov.sg    FB fb.com/SCDFpage    IG Instagram.com/mySCDF 
 
WARNING: "Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended addressee, you must not 
copy, distribute or take any action in reliance thereon. Communication of any information in this email to any unauthorized person is 
an offence under the Official Secrets Act (Cap 213). Please notify the sender immediately if you receive this in error." 

 

From: Xin Yu (LKK Auto) <xinyu@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, 18 October 2022 2:15 pm 
To: Md Arriffin YUSOPE (SCDF) <Md_Arriffin_YUSOPE@scdf.gov.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Li Feng ANG (SCDF) <ANG_Li_Feng@scdf.gov.sg> 
Subject: RE: New Fire Report Application - FR2022101708755 
 
Dear Sir/Madam, 
 

a. Designation of the applicant   Admin Assistant 
b. Relationship to the case          insurance company, Ergo Insurance 
c. Representing party Representing Ergo Insurance company 
d. Reason(s) for purchase           Insurance request for own damage 

 
 
Thanks and Warmest Regards, 

Xin Yu  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

phone: 6256-3561 | email: XinYu@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 
From: Md Arriffin YUSOPE (SCDF) <Md_Arriffin_YUSOPE@scdf.gov.sg>  
Sent: Tuesday, 18 October 2022 11:03 AM 
To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Li Feng ANG (SCDF) <ANG_Li_Feng@scdf.gov.sg> 
Subject: FW: New Fire Report Application - FR2022101708755 
 
Dear Sir, 
 
This is a verification check for Fire Report Application - Request no. FR2022101708755 
 
Before we process your request, we seek your assistance to kindly provide the necessary details :  
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a. Designation of the applicant   
b. Relationship to the case         (e.g. insurance company, affected party (owner / tenant / 

neighbour), private company, law firm, loss adjustor) 
c. Representing party (e.g. acting on behalf of owner / tenant / organization, self-

representing). Pls include the name of the person / company you 
are representing. 

d. Reason(s) for purchase           
 
Please note that the Fire Report and investigation findings are only released to related parties (ie owner/occupants/insurance 
companies/etc) of the affected unit/entity through the online application.   
 
We hope to receive a response from you soon. 
 
 
Thank you 
 
SWO MOHD ARRIFFIN BIN YUSOPE 
FIRE INVESTIGATOR 
Fire Investigation Unit | Operations Department 
HQ Singapore Civil Defence Force 
DID: (65) 6848 3349| FAX: (65) 6848 3368 

    
Singapore Civil Defence Force   W SCDF.gov.sg    FB fb.com/SCDFpage    IG Instagram.com/mySCDF 
 
WARNING: "Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended addressee, you must not 
copy, distribute or take any action in reliance thereon. Communication of any information in this email to any unauthorized person is 
an offence under the Official Secrets Act (Cap 213). Please notify the sender immediately if you receive this in error." 

 
From: scdf_sod@scdf.gov.sg <scdf_sod@scdf.gov.sg>  
Sent: Monday, 17 October 2022 4:43 pm 
To: June YAP (SCDF) <June_YAP@scdf.gov.sg>; Md Arriffin YUSOPE (SCDF) <Md_Arriffin_YUSOPE@scdf.gov.sg>; Zahari MD ZAIN 
(SCDF) <Zahari_Md_Zain@scdf.gov.sg>; Dannies ANG (SCDF) <Dannies_ANG@scdf.gov.sg>; Cindy HAN (SCDF) 
<Cindy_HAN@scdf.gov.sg>; Rashid MOHD NOOR (SCDF) <Rashid_Mohd_Noor@scdf.gov.sg>; Li Feng ANG (SCDF) 
<ANG_Li_Feng@scdf.gov.sg>; Weikang HUANG (SCDF) <HUANG_Weikang@scdf.gov.sg>; Md Faizal MAZLAN (SCDF) 
<Md_Faizal_MAZLAN@scdf.gov.sg>; Shahril SULAIMAN (SCDF) <Shahril_SULAIMAN@scdf.gov.sg>; Kamisah HAJI KAMIM (MHA) 
<Kamisah_HAJI_KAMIM@mha.gov.sg>; Norhayati NORDIN (MHA) <Norhayati_NORDIN@mha.gov.sg>; Zainab MAJID (MHA) 
<Zainab_MAJID@mha.gov.sg>; Elaine WONG (MHA) <Elaine_WONG@mha.gov.sg>; Wei Jeat WONG (MHA) 
<WONG_Wei_Jeat@mha.gov.sg>; Poh Choo HENG (MHA) <HENG_Poh_Choo@mha.gov.sg>; Guoxing LIM (MHA) 
<LIM_Guoxing@mha.gov.sg>; Nick LI (SCDF) <Nick_LI@scdf.gov.sg> 
Subject: New Fire Report Application - FR2022101708755 
 

Transaction Number: FR2022101708755 

INCIDENT DETAILS 

Date and Time 10/10/2022 15:00 

Location of Fire 171 Paya Lebar Rd, Singapore 409048 

Fire Involved Motorcar - GBA9564B 

REQUESTOR DETAILS 

Requestor Type Insurance Companies 

Requestor ID Type Foreign International Requestor ID G****339Q 

Name of Applicant LOH XIN YU 

Company Name LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD 
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INCIDENT DETAILS 

Company UEN  

Company Reference 
Number 

CS/EGI22010095/Rcy3 

CONTACT DETAILS 

Mode of Collection Email 

Main Contact No. 62563561 Office No.  

Handphone No.  Fax No.  

Email Address SUR@LKKAUTO.COM 

Address 

Block No. 51 Floor No. 02 Unit No. 25 

Street Name UBI AVE 1 

Building Name 
PAYA LEBAR INDUSTRIAL 
PARK 

Postal Code 408933 

PAYMENT DETAILS 

Payment Mode Credit/Debit Card 

EP Reference No. 20221017163406220 

PSi Reference No. 89522663425012697 

Total Fees SGD170.00 

 


