Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 17 January 2023 8:52 PM

To: Tan Lee Gek (Strides Automotive Services Pte Ltd); Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Cc: CS A Team; Admin A

Subject: RE: LOD Re: Accident on 5/10/2022 involving SHB 5329P & SHC 3426A (AXA's
insured) Our Ref: TAX/10/22/2019/Ig *** LKK REF: CC4/ASM22010071/Rpa3

Attachments: 10 22 2019 - document.pdf

Dear Sir / Madam,

Thank you for your email.

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and get back to you in due course.
Hi HT,

Kindly assist.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Tan Lee Gek (Strides Automotive Services Pte Ltd) <LeeGek.Tan@strides.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, January 17, 2023 4:31 PM

To: CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: LOD Re: Accident on 5/10/2022 involving SHB 5329P & SHC 3426A (AXA's insured) Our Ref:
TAX/10/22/2019/Ig

Dear All,

We quantify our own losses as follows:-

Cost of Repair $1,600.00
Loss of Rental $700.00 ( 10 daysx $70.00 )
Total $2,300.00

We enclose the following documents:-
1) Repair invoice
2) Proof of rental rate
3) GIA report
4) Accident vehicle laid-up report

Please acknowledge receipt within 14 days from the date hereof and let us have your offer soon. Thanks.



Regards

Tan Lee Gek (DID: 6556 3548)

Claims Department

STRIDES Automotive Services Pte Ltd

STRIDES
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