Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

Sent: Thursday, 3 November 2022 12:19 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Subject: SGJ 3288 G - finalised

Attachments: SGJ 3288 main estimate1.11.pdf; SGJ 3288 supp1.pdf
Hi Veron,

Can closed.

Thanks.

Best Regards,

Steve Chen| Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 81117723/6256-3561 | email: stevenfoong@lkkauto.com| fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Pat-Shu Fatt Auto Works <shufatt@singnet.com.sg>
Sent: Thursday, 3 November 2022 11:14 am

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: RE: SGJ 3288 G - finalised

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Steve,

Cost of Repair confirmed: $13,150.00 lump sum before GST.
6 days.

Thanks & regards,
Pat
Shu Fatt Auto Works

From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Thursday, November 3, 2022 9:41 AM

To: Pat-Shu Fatt Auto Works <shufatt@singnet.com.sg>
Subject: SGJ 3288 G - finalised

Hi Pat,

Kindly refer our finalize $13,150.00 (L/S, before GST). 6 days.



Tkanks.

Best Regards,

Steve Chen| Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 81117723/6256-3561 | email: stevenfoong@Ikkauto.com| fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Pat-Shu Fatt Auto Works <shufatt@singnet.com.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, 25 October 2022 3:31 pm

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: SGJ 3288 G - finalised

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Steve,
Please see attached :

1. Supplementary;
2. Finalised calculations; and
3. After paint photos.

Cost of repair: $13,300.00 lump sum before GST.
6 days.

Thanks & regards,
Pat
Shu Fatt Auto Works



