Celine Fong (LKKAuto)

From: kohwc1 <bikeworkz@gmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 5 October 2022 10:19 AM

To: Celine Fong (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: Accident involving FBK 2803E and SHD 4233C on 18.01.2022
hi Celine,

ok, pls proceed.

beng

On Mon, Oct 3, 2022 at 3:36 PM Celine Fong (LKKAuto) <celinefong@Ilkkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Sir,

Finalised Lump Sum $3,450.00 and 3 days.

Best Regards,
Celine Fong
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6256-3561 | email: celinefong@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



