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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Sent: Thursday, 6 October 2022 8:52 AM
To: karzauto345@gmail.com
Subject: Claim Notification - ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBD9363Z(CHINA TAIPING) AND 

SJY419B AT/ALONG CTE TOWARDS PIE ON 28/09/2022

Karz Automobile & Leasing Pte Ltd                                    [By Email Only] 
Driver: Muhammad Badrun Bin Adbul Nasir 
  
Dear Sir/Madam, 
  
You Ref: GBD9363Z 
Our Ref: CC6/CTI22009818/Apa3 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBD9363Z(CHINA TAIPING) AND SJY419B AT/ALONG CTE TOWARDS PIE ON 28/09/2022 
  
We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed by your motor 
insurer, China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd to deal with the third party claim against your policy. 
  
We have received a claim from SJY419B against your motor insurance policy. 
  
Based on the accident report and accident scenario, we are of the view that liability is not in your driver's favour. 
Therefore, we shall proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement of the third party claim at best to avoid further 
litigation, which would escalate to even more cost. 
  
Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please contact 
us within 07 days from the date of this letter. 
  
Thank you. 
 
 
 

 
Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 
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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Sent: Thursday, 19 January 2023 4:45 PM
To: Jenny Lew
Cc: Claims Dept of CTI; Admin A
Subject: RE: [SEEK MANDATE] - SNM22D206988/C02/GBD9363Z/LEWLC / RE: Direct 

Settlement - Accident Involving GBD9363Z (OI : CTI - TBA) AND SJY419B (TP : LKK 
REF - CC6/CTI22009818/Apa3) on 28/09/2022

Dear Sirs, 
 
For an update, we have settled the matter at a global sum of $13,400.00(all-in) with third party. 
 
We will proceed to close file and submit all the necessary documents once it is ready. 
 
Thank you. 
 
 
 

 
Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

 
 

From: Jenny Lew <jenny.lew@sg.cntaiping.com>  
Sent: Thursday, 12 January 2023 9:26 AM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: [SEEK MANDATE] - SNM22D206988/C02/GBD9363Z/LEWLC / RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving 
GBD9363Z (OI : CTI - TBA) AND SJY419B (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CTI22009818/Apa3) on 28/09/2022 
 
Hi Hsiao Tong 
  
Pls proceed as follows: 

   

1. Cost of Repair  $ 12,500.00 
2. Loss of RENTAL  $   1,120.00 (7DAYS X $160.00) 
3. LTA/ GIA SEARCH FEE $           7.45 

Total $ 13,627.45 
  
  
Regards, 
  
Jenny Lew 
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Executive 
Claims Department 
  
China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. 
3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909   
DID: (65) 6389 6172 | Tel: (65) 6389 6116 |   F: (65) 6224 7175 
   
W: www.sg.cntaiping.com   |    FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/   |   WeChat: 太平狮城 Taiping SG  
  
Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential information. Any 
unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please 
notify the sender immediately. Please delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter. 
  
From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, 10 January 2023 11:22 am 
To: Jenny Lew <jenny.lew@sg.cntaiping.com> 
Cc: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: [SEEK MANDATE] - SNM22D206988/C02/GBD9363Z/LEWLC / RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving 
GBD9363Z (OI : CTI - TBA) AND SJY419B (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CTI22009818/Apa3) on 28/09/2022 
  

  

Your ref: SNM22D206988/C02/GBD9363Z/LEWLC 
LKK ref : CC6/CTI22009818/Apa3q2 
  
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
  
ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBD9363Z(CHINA TAIPING) AND SJY419B(TP) ON 28/09/2022 
  
We refer to the above matter. 
  
It is a head-to-rear collision. We are of the view that liability is not in our driver’s favour. 
  
We seek your approval to offer repairer “HUA MENG SPRAY PAINTING WORKSHOP" at $13,627.45(all-in). 
  
The summary is as follows: - 
  

  Amount Claimed Amount Revised 
1. Cost of Repair  $ 23,068.60 $ 12,500.00 
2. Loss of RENTAL (7days x $200.00) $   1,400.00 $   1,120.00 (7DAYS X $160.00) 
3. LTA/ GIA SEARCH FEE $           7.45 $           7.45 

Total $ 24,476.05 $ 13,627.45 
  
Surveyor recommended 8days for repair. 
  
Enclosed here with all the relevant documents for your perusal. 
  
Kindly note that this inspection report dated 06/01/2023 is only for mandate purpose. 
  
Kindly let us have your approval / instruction. 
  
Best Regards, 
Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

 CAUTION: This email originated from outside the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you 
recognize the sender and know the content is safe.  
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HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
  
  
  
-----Original Message----- 
From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)  
Sent: Tuesday, 27 December 2022 5:27 PM 
To: Jenny Lew <jenny.lew@sg.cntaiping.com>; Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com> 
Subject: RE: SNM22D206988/C02/GBD9363Z/LEWLC / RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBD9363Z (OI : CTI 
- TBA) AND SJY419B (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CTI22009818/Apa3) on 28/09/2022 
  
Dear Sirs/ Mdm, 
  
Enclosed for your perusal is: - 
  
•             Estimated cost of repair. 
•             Preliminary advice. 
•             Photographs of TP vehicle in its damaged condition 
  
Thank you. 
  
  
Best Regards, 
Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 
S(408933) 
  
  
  
-----Original Message----- 
From: Jenny Lew <jenny.lew@sg.cntaiping.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, 5 October 2022 3:04 PM 
To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com> 
Subject: RE: SNM22D206988/C02/GBD9363Z/LEWLC / RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBD9363Z (OI : CTI 
- TBA) AND SJY419B (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CTI22009818/Apa3) on 28/09/2022 
  
This is a Secure PDF message. This email has been protected as an encrypted PDF document. 
  
Please retrieve the PDF password from https://se-password.secureage.com/#/?id=f782674a-f0b8-41ae-86fc-
4f6528ce6df1 and open the encrypted PDF attachment to view your secure message. If you have problem accessing 
the encrypted message, please contact the sender of the message. 
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